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Eternal Life ! What is it ? 
Notes of an Address by J. ALEXANDER CLARKE, Central Africa 

Scriptures read: 1 John:1-10; 2:1-2; 5:12-13 

My subject this evening is Eternal Life. 
What is it? Who have it? Were I to in-
quire of each individual in this large audi-
ence if they had eternal life every true 
believer would respond with a glad alac-
rity; "yes indeed!" But were I to ask again 
"when did you receive this gift of God" 
there would be a variety of answers; in-
deed, perhaps, a reluctancy to give an 
exact date, for the Spirit still moves where 
He willeth and His movements are still as 
mysterious as the wind which blows. The 
vital matter is to know now that you are 
born of God and that the life of the ages is 
indeed yours, unmistakably yours. For us 
all the temptation is ever present to rest in 
a past experience and to become mere re-
ligionists observing certain ordinances and 
conforming to forms of ritual which, not-
withstanding their scriptural simplicity, 
when divorced from the loving presence of 
Christ only serve to harden the heart. 
Eternal life is the life of the ages. This is 
the life that was manifested in Christ. This 
is the life which He laid down and took up 
again. In the mystery of so doing He has 
put this same life at the disposal of every 
believing heart. John emphasizes the truth 
that this life is a present possession. He 
that believeth HATH eternal life; Paul 
approaching the subject from another an-
gle underlines the fact that it must be laid 
hold of: "Lay hold of eternal life." They 
are not contradictory but complementary 
rather; the only true proof of the posses-
sion of eternal life is the constant appro-
priation of its vital elements which work-
ing in us and through us make for the 
same characteristics which marked Christ 
in whom this life had perfect and abundant 
expression; "In Him was life"; "I am come 
that they might have life . . . more abun- 

dantly." "These things have I written unto 
you that believe on the name of the son of 

God, that ye may know that ye have eter- 
nal life and that ye may believe on the 

name of the Son of God." Three times 
over does John say "These things have I 
written" thus emphasizing the importance 
of the subject—these things surely refer 
to the whole body of truth contained in 
the Gospel of John. This short letter was 
a postscript to the Gospel. Not a P. S. in 
the sense in which you and I add a P. S. to 
our letters when we have forgotten some-
thing. No! The Apostle energized and 
equipped by the Spirit forgot nothing but 
having completed the evangel he now 
writes this wonderful short letter to sup-
plement and confirm the truth of the un-
veiling of the Son of God. Gnosticism—
know everything — insidiously and dev-
astatingly had made inroads into the 
Church even at that early date and belov-
ed John, now an old man, stirred by the 
Spirit and with a great love for the Saints 
writes "these things" unto them. (1) That 
their joy might be full, (2) that they sin 
not, (3) that they may know that they 
have eternal life. 

That Their Joy Might Be Full 
This joy is one of the fruits of the Spirit 

springing from the knowledge of Christ as 
Son of God who loved us and gave Him-
self for us. It is deep and abiding. It is 
more than happiness. This may be easily 
disturbed for it lies on the surface. Hap-
piness has to do with "happenings" and is 
therefore superficial. Joy on the other 
hand is that calm and serene quality which 
possesses the soul amidst life's storms and 
gives strength to endure. They say that on 
the vast ocean there is eternal calm, only 
a few fathoms below the surface, which is 
never ruffled by the strong winds and great 
waves. So this joy of God keeps the soul 
calm and peaceful amidst the trials and 
troubles which may sweep our outer life. 

That They Sin Not 
"That ye sin not"; how prone we are to 

excuse ourselves for lapsing into sin again 
and again. We speak of the corruptness of 
our old nature and treat it as lightly as 
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one might freckles on the skin. Sin is the 
kill-joy. Yet many of us refuse to consider 
our constant hardness of heart, unkind-
ness of spirit and selfishness of life as any-
thing more than a slight peccadillo. The 
possessor of eternal life cannot go on sin-
ning—it is not the Father's desire for any 
one of His children that he should sin. 
Strong emphasis is often times put on the 
need of deep conviction of sin before the 
realization of forgiveness. Yet in the lives 
of the Saints the sense of sin has been 
ever present with them. Not something 
coming to them once for all but abiding 
with them as they dwell in the revealing 
yet benign light of the Master's presence. 
This requires to be restated powerfully 
and incisively these days of unkind words 
and unkind silences, which stab deeper 
than the spoken thrust. Perhaps the com-
monest sin obtaining today is the irrit-
ability and loss of temper with its conse-
quent rashness of speech. Oh! how often 
we have excused this weakness instead of 
condemning it as sin and confessing it to 
our Lord who has promised full restora-
tion through the efficacy of His blood, 
"That ye may not sin," and shall we go on 
condoning the unforgiving spirit forget-
ting that only in the measure we are 
ready to forgive freely and frankly will we 
be forgiven. The first movement in our 
heart by the Spirit is one of forgiveness, 
how then can we possibly be possessors of 
eternal life unless we are prepared to for-
give one another freely and frankly even 
as we also have been forgiven of God. Not 
even waiting for confession to be made 
unto us, for God put away sin before we 
betrayed any interest whatsoever in Him. 
Confession brought joy of fellowship and 
communion with Him. So we also ought 
to forgive before even any advance is 
made on the part of any one who has 
seemingly wronged us, so that when he 
does approach us we can welcome him 
with gladness having already freely for-
given all. This is God-like. My experience 
in dealing with our African brethren has 

proved to me that human nature is very 

much the same whether covered with 

black or white skin. One of the early con-
verts in our African work after a few 
years of fine service for his Lord was 
severely tested. And although at first he 
sadly failed yet afterwards he came forth 
into the peace of victory. It was domestic 
trouble so serious that only separation 
from his wife seemed the solution. It was 
a serious matter for him and for us upon 
whom the cares of the Church fell, but he 
was adamant in his resolve to send her 
away. He did so, but a whole moon of 
days brought no relief so in his despair 
bursting upon me one night he unbur-
dened his heart "What must I do, Master?" 
"Show me the way." Knowing the wrong 
he had done the first impulse was to cen-
sure him and expose the error unmerci-
fully. But considering my own failure my 
spirit was chastened and I was brought 
into that condition of heart where God 
could use me to bring back one of His wan-
dering, straying children. Together we 
prayed and besought divine forgiveness 
and were received and pardoned. Then 
came the pertinent question again. "What 
must I do?" Tenderly we sought to show 
him the right path. And he must go after 
his wife—confess his sin to her and bring 
her back—but said he with vehemence—
"She was in the wrong!" Does this sound 
familiar my brethren? It is always the 
other fellow who is in the wrong. Away 
he went in the first streak of dawn to find 
the wife he so hastily drove away. Find-
ing her he confessed his wrong as a Christ's 
one and besought forgiveness—She was a 
Mwine—Satana (Satan's one) and he a 
Mwine-Kristu (Christ's one) and such be-
ing the case he was to be blamed. But he 
brought her home and forgiving all, joy 
was restored and a new glad communion 
entered into—the happy sequel was the 
conversion of his wife. Several months 
after this first sad event he brought his 
wife to me declaring that she also was 
now a Christ's one. He had won her for 
his Master and Lord in the secret of their 
own home life. Thus grace expressing it-
self in the forgiving spirit triumphed. 

(Continued in May Issue) 
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The "Lifting Up" of Our Savior 
By G. M. J. LEAR, Argentina 
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The gospel of John is unique in its 
presentation of God's good news for men, 
both in regard to the Person of the Lord 
and in regard to His mission. In His Per-
son He is seen as the "Sent One of the 
Father," a Heavenly Being in strangership 
upon earth; His mission is seen to be the 
manifesting of divine glory to men and the 
bringing of glory to the Father in a scene 
where man had so grievously failed. In 
accordance with this, we have the peculiar 
use of the word "lifted up" three times in 
this precious record of our Lord's min-
istry: (1) John 3: 14: "As Moses lifted up 
the serpent . . . so must the Son of man be 
lifted up"—where it is in connection with 
His PASSION. (2) John 8: 28: "When ye 
have lifted up the Son of man, then shall 
ye know that I am"—where it is in con-
nection with His PERSON. And (3) John 
12: 32: "And I, if I be lifted up from the 
earth, will draw all men unto me"—where 
it is in connection with His POWER. The 
same word here translated "lifted up" is 
rendered "exalted" in Acts 2: 33 and 5: 31, 
where it has clear reference to the glorifi-
cation of the Son; but in John's gospel the 
use of the word includes "the sufferings of 
Christ and the glories that should follow." 

I. The "Lifting Up" in Regard to 
His Passion 

When an Israelite approached the door 
of the tabernacle, the first object that at-
tracted his attention within the court was 
the altar. The very word altar means "to 
set on high," that is, to place the object 
offered in a position of such prominence 
that the eyes would naturally fasten upon 
it and the mind would consider its mean-
ing. Our text says: "As Moses lifted up 
the serpent in the wilderness," thus es-
tablishing a comparison between the ser-
pent on the pole and the Redeemer on the 
cross. Let reader and writer together 

c`. . . . survey the wondrous cross 
On which the Lord of Glory died" 

and let us trace the correspondence be- 
tween the wilderness scene and Calvary. 

There are three directions given to Moses 
referring to the serpent: (1) "Make thee 
a fiery serpent," (2) "set it upon a pole," 
(3) "every one that . . . looketh shall live." 
First, then, the making of the serpent. 
What a deep mystery is here set forth! 
Death was reigning in the camp of Israel; 
the cause of death was the bite of the ser-
pents, the fruit of sin. Moses, according 
to God's word, makes a serpent of brass, 
the metal used in the tabernacle to sym-
bolize capacity to resist the fire of judg-
ment. How wonderfully this brings before 
us the coming of the Savior into this 
world, in which death and distress were 
ruling; He comes to face God's righteous 
judgment against sin, being "made sin" 
for us, He Who "knew no sin." Regarding 
this, Mr. W. Kelley says: "Had He known 
sin, He could not have been a Savior ac-
cording to divine holiness; had He not 
been made sin, we had never been really 
delivered from its judgment." 

But now, in the second place, we have 
the expression, "set it upon a pole," which 
gives us the idea of "lifted up." (a) What 
a spectacle for GOD to gaze upon! Nay, 
rather, He hides His face and discharges 
His wrath upon that divine Sufferer, Who 
has "become a curse for us; for it is writ-
ten, Cursed is every one that is hanged 
upon a tree" (Ga1.3: 13) . (b) What a sight 
for the SINNER to gaze upon! The desert 
experiences of Israel have shown the utter 
ruin of man in the flesh: murmering, un-
belief and rebellion have characterized 
them all the way through. But here is 
"One Who was willing to die in my stead," 
assuming all responsibility for wretched, 
sinful man. (c) What a view for SATAN 
and his angels to behold! As he is not 
omniscient, and knowing that the Scrip-
ture prophecies of future glory in connec-
tion with Israel were bound up in the 
Messiah, it would have seemed to him and 
his diabolical hosts that a final and crush-
ing victory had been gained when the 
Christ of God, after hours of agony on the 
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cross, at last enters into the domains of 
death. But our blessed Lord turned ap-
parent tragedy into magnificent triumph, 
disclosing the divine secret hidden in God 
through the ages, the forming of the 
Church as the heavenly bride of the Lamb. 

In the third place we notice that 
"everyone that looketh shall live." There 
is no blessing from God for the sinner 
apart from the Savior , of His providing. 
There must be the look of faith: that 
4hich links the sinner in his abject need 
with the Savior in His perfect sufficiency. 
We cannot preach ethics or character-
forming as the ground of salvation, we 
have to declare salvation as the ground of 
character-forming. The basis of our faith 
is the pledged word of God and the object 
of our faith is the crucified Lamb of God. 

II. The "Lifting Up" in Regard to 
His Person 

When the priest went into the Holy 
Place, he was surrounded by objects which 
spoke of Christ: the three pieces of furni-
ture speak of Him as the Food of God, 
the Witness for God, and the Intercessor 
before God. So, by this second mention of 
His being "lifted up," our Lord leads us on 
from His sacrifice to His present occupa-
tion. The mystery of His person will be 
fully established, when this "lifting up" is 
seen to include His being raised from the 
dead and exalted to the right hand of God 
the Father (see Rom.1: 4) . Everything He 
has done has been to please the Father, 
and when men had carried out their wick-
ed designs against Him, the Father would 
receive Him up into glory and "then shall 
ye know that I AM." Here we not only 
get our Lord's assumption of the divine 
title I AM, but also a reminiscence of the 
phrase so often used in Ezekiel, "Then 
shall ye know that I am the Lord" (see 
Ezek.37: 6,13, etc.) . It is remarkable, too, 
that in this chapter 37 of Ezekiel the ex-
pression is used in connection with the 
"death" and "resurrection" of Israel, just 
as our Lord makes reference to it here in 
connection with His death and resurrec-
tion. His oneness with the Father is thus 
brought out on one hand, and His oneness  

with His people is brought out on the 
other. What mysteries are enshrined in 
this aspect of the "lifting up" of the Son 
of man! Here again we notice that the 
link with His person, as with His work (as 
we saw in the former section) , comes by 
faith: "If ye believe not that I am, ye shall 
die in your sins." 

III. The "Lifting Up" in Regard to 
His Power 

After the Holy Place comes the Holiest 
of All, the inner glory, the great centre of 
the tabernacle, for which all else had been 
made. "Thou that dwellest between the 
cherubim" (Psa.80: 1) was the appellation 
of Jehovah Himself. "Thou that inhabitest 
the praises of Israel" (Psa.22: 3) gives us 
the idea of His people being gathered to-
gether around Him as the Centre of their 
worship. "And I, if I be lifted up from the 
earth, will draw all unto me." The oc-
casion of these words is the coming of the 
Greeks, who had arrived in Jerusalem for 
the Passover, but who are now seen as 
desiring to see Jesus. In view of this, He 
speaks of the glorification of the Son of 
man, an expression which includes His 
being lifted up: He becomes the Centre of 
attraction for all peoples. The Greeks that 
came to seek Him are simply an earnest 
of the great harvest that He sees as the 
result of His stupendous sacrifice. It is in-
structive to compare the phrase, "into the 
ground" (v.24) with the phrase, "from the 
earth" (v.32) , the words "ground" and 
"earth" being the same in the original: the 
one denotes direction towards, and the 
other denotes direction away from (or, lit-
erally, "out of") ; in the one we see the 
sowing, in the other the reaping. The corn 
of wheat must fall into the earth, and then 
it apparently gets destroyed; but only thus 
can come the fields of golden glory. Out of 
the Death of the Son of man comes life 
everlasting; out of the Darkness He en-
dured comes light unsullied; out of the 
Distress of His soul comes deliverance for 
the sinner; out of seeming Defeat comes 
final and eternal victory. This lifting up of 
the Son of man will have as its ultimate 
result the gathering together of the whole 



LIGHT AND LIBERTY 103 

universe around His blessed Person, and a 
multitude that no man can number will 
attribute to Him undying, God-honoring 
praises for all eternity. 

Surely here we have reached the Holy 
of Holies. Here we are gazing upon the 
mysterious, unspeakable, unexplainable 
glories of our Lord and Savior. It is the 
fulfilment of the ancient prophecy: "Be-
hold my Servant . . . shall be exalted and 
extolled and be LIFTED UP" (the same 
word being used in the Septuagint in Isa. 
52:13, as in John 12:32; Acts 2:33; etc.) . 
Brethren,what unutterable blessing is ours 
as we contemplate the Lord of Glory: 

LIFTED UP as a Redeeming Sacrifice; 
LIFTED UP as a Risen Savior; 
LIFTED UP as a Returning Sovereign. 

"Love",  
By EDWIN J. THARP, China 

"Behold, what manner of love the Fa-
ther hath bestowed upon us, that we 
should be called the sons of God." 1 John 
3:1.  

The full measure of this wonderful 
love of God in making us His children is 
seen in His unspeakable Gift on the one 
hand and in our utter worthlessness on 
the other. "For God so loved the world 
(i.e., actually sinful ruined man; for no 
man no world) that He gave (oh! priceless 
gift!) His only begotten Son, that whoso-
ever believeth in Him should not perish, 
but have everlasting life." God's love-gift 
is not measured by the size of the world 
but by the nature or quality of the Gift. 
Man was originally made in the like-
ness and image of God, but sin had 
effaced or defaced that likeness and image 
entirely, so that not by any stretch of im-
agination could he be looked upon as a son 
or child of God. But what was the NATURE 

or QUALITY of God's gift to the world? 
You say, "He gave a son, even His only 
begotten Son, who WAS the image of the 
invisible God, and in whom ALL THE FUL-

NESS of the Godhead dwelt or reposed 
bodily; one who WAS the brightness of 
His glory and the EXPRESS IMAGE of His 
person." This is all true of Him in incar- 

nation in spite of the fact that God sent 
Him in the likeness of sinful flesh. (Col. 
1:15,19; 2: 9; Heb.1: 3; Rom.8: 3.) But nei-
ther the measure of God's marvellous love 
nor the nature nor quality of His gift is 
seen in this beautiful fact. For God to have 
given such a Son to the world, even though 
it was His only begotten Son, merely to 
live with man in order to manifest by his 
life, example, and teaching that He was 
the image of the invisible God; that He 
was the express image of His person; the 
very effulgence of His glory; would only 
have had the effect of condemning man 
and still leaving him eternally without 
God and without hope. And we know too, 
that it is expressly stated, "That God sent 
not His Son into the world to condemn the 
world, but that the world through him 
might be saved" (John 3:17) . What then 
is the measure of this measureless love 
and the nature or quality of God's great 
Gift to the world? The Gospel of John 
must always be read in the light of that 
other wonderful exclamation. "Behold the 
lamb of God, which taketh away the sin of 
the world!" Which statement even trans-
cends, "In the beginning was the Word 
. . . the Word was God; the Word became 
flesh" (John 1: 1,14) . Then too we must 
ever read John's first epistle in the light 
of, "The blood of Jesus Christ, His son 
cleanseth us from all sin." If we bear this 
in mind we can perhaps get some little 
idea both of the measure and nature or 
quality of this wondrous love and Gift. 

The true measure of the love and na-
ture and quality of the Gift is seen in that 
it was a sacrificial Gift on the part of a sin 
hating God to a sin-loving world! God 
sacrificed His own spotless, blemishless, 
sinless Son! He graciously laid His hand 
upon the uplifted arm of Abraham when 
the life-taking blow was about to fall upon 
his son; and while this act stands, as a 
monument of Faith to the offerer, there 
would have been no merit or virtue in the 
sacrifice of a sinful human being. But, 
"HE SPARED NOT His ONLY Sox," but de-
livered Him up (to the sin-offering altar) 
for us all. The knife came very near to the 
life of Isaac, even as the fire came very 
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near the lives of the three Hebrew young 
men in the fiery furnace; insomuch that it 
sundered the very cords that bound them, 
but it did not actually so much as scorch 
or touch their persons; or even leave the 
smell of fire upon them, for THEY WERE NOT 
ALONE IN THE FURNACE, One greater 
than the fire WALKED WITH THEM in that 
great trial. But the uplifted knife of God 
against sin (man-sin, or world-sin) was 
plunged up to the very hilt into the heart 
of His beloved, His only begotten son in 
order that He might take (or bear) away 
our sin, and cleanse us from our sins; and 
let us remember, that in this fiery furnace 
of all fiery furnaces, HE WAS ALONE!! And 
it was through this 

Love of All Loves and Gift of All Gifts 
He made us "Children of God." We are 
already new creatures (or a new creation) 
in Him, but He is actually going to renew 
in our minds and persons the "Image and 
likeness of God," for when we SEE HIM we 
are to be LIKE HIM! 

No wonder after the beloved Apostle 
had paused and beheld or looked upon 
that marvellous Love-Gift, he should go 
on to say, "And every man that hath this 
hope in Him purifieth himself even as He 
is pure!" By which he means, "That as He 
who offered up His body as a sacrifice in 
death for sin, came through that terrible 
ordeal, without a trace or vestige of de-
filement or corruption, and is thus "PURE," 
so we should seek to purify ourselves 
through the "Washing of the water of the 
Word," and endeavor to be free from sin 
as we daily "Present (or offer) our bodies 
as a LIVING SACRIFICE, holy, acceptable to 
God;" which in the light of all that LOVE 
and GIFT should mean to us, is but our 
"Reasonable service" to Him! And thus 
may we show that we not only know but 
also appreciate something of the measure 
and nature or quality of God's amazing 
and marvellous LOVE-GIFT. 

It is not a day for questionings, but a 
day for setting Christ before the hearts the 
great object outside ourselves, Himself. 

E.P.C. 

The Three-fold Name o f 
Our Lord 

By SAMUEL TAYLOR, Ontario 

The Logos, or The Word, is an eternal 
name of our adorable Lord Jesus Christ. 
Unless the expression in Luke 1: 2 be 
taken in a personal sense, it is peculiar, in 
the New Testament, to the writings of 
John. The Gospel calls Him "The Word"; 
the First Epistle designates Him "The 
Word of Life"; and the Revelation names 
Him "The Word of God." The first form 
of the appellation is applied to our Lord 
in His pre-incarnate state in connection 
with what He "was," and with what He 
"became" (John 1:1,14). The second form is 
given to Him in His incarnate state as the 
One in Whose Person and life on earth v as 
manifested "that eternal life which v as 
with the Father" (1 John 1: 1,2) . The third 
form is used of Him in His resurrection 
state, as coming from heaven in judgment 
(Rev.19: 13) . 

I. The Word 
(a) The Eternal Word. Genesis opens 

with a work in time; John opens with The 
Word in eternity. "In the beginning v as 
the Word," is a plain affirmation of His 
eternal being. 

(b) The Personal Word. The distinct 
personality of the Word in the essential 
unity of the Godhead is taught in the 
clause, "and the Word was with God." 
God subsists in three co-equal Persons — 
Father, Son, and Holy Spirit. Scripture 
identifies the Son and the Word as the 
same Second Person in the blessed, holy, 
eternal Trinity. 

The Son, as such, was with the Father, 
i.e., in John 17: 5, "as to presence and 
place": as the Word, He was with God. 
Here a different preposition is used, which 
word expresses, "beyond the fact of co-
existence or imminence, the more signifi-
cant fact of perpetual intercommunion." 
(See 1 John 1: 2 and 1 John 2: 1) . 

(c) The Divine Word. The true, prop-
er, essential Deity of the Word is clearly 
stated in the clause, "and the Word v as 
God." An attempt has been made to deny 
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that this statement teaches the true Deity 
of our Lord, because the article does not 
appear before the word God. Were the 
article so placed, the construction would 
limit Deity to the Word and destroy the 
doctrine of the Trinity: but Holy Scrip-
ture is accurate; it expresses the Deity of 
the Word in a manner that perfectly har-
monizes with the ascription of Deity to the 
Father and to the Holy Spirit. 

(d) The Creative Word. "In the be-
ginning God created . . ." (Gen.1: 1) , but 
the Son, Who is also the Word, was the 
One "by whom also He made the worlds" 
(Heb.1: 2) . "All things were made by 
Him (The Word) , and without Him was 
not anything made that was made (John 
1: 3) . 

Three prepositions are used in Col.1: 
16, that express different relations of the 
Son to creation—en, dia, and eis. The first 
teaches that all things were created in the 
intrinsic power of the Son; the second ex-
presses instrument and shows that He was 
the active Agent in creation—that He did 
the act; and the third points to Him as the 
object or end of creation. Darby gives the 
force of the respective words thus: "the 
characteristic power, active instrument, 
and end." Hence, as related to the crea-
tion of all things our Lord Jesus Christ is 
the Cause, the Agent, and the Purpose. 

(e) The Life -indwelling Word. Crea-
tion was "through" the Word, and it re-
veals the "eternal power and divinity" of 
God (Rom.1: 20) ; but life was "in" Him, 
"and the life was the light of men" (John 
1: 4) . 

The Word is related to God (John 1: 1) , 
to creation (v.3) , and to men (v.4) . 

(f) The Incarnate Word. "The Word 
became flesh and dwelt among us . . ." 
(John 1: 14, R.v.) . Flesh is here used "by 
synecdoche, of the holy humanity of the 
Lord Jesus in the totality of all that is 
essential to manhood, i.e., spirit, soul, and 
body." Our Lord "became" what He was 
not before—man (v.14) , but remained what 
He eternally "was"—God (v.1) , so that 
He is now truly God and truly man in 
One Person. 

The glory of the Incarnate Word which 

John and others were so highly privileged 
to behold, or to contemplate, is described 
as "a glory as of an only begotten with a 
father" (John 1: 14, N.T.) . 

II. The Word of Life 
The Word is a name applied to our 

Lord in His essential Deity (John 1: 1) . A 
certain book makes the statement that, 
"John starts with the claim that the Word 
was Deity, and became flesh to be the 
Word"; but John 1: 1 plainly states that in 
His eternal pre-existence He "was" the 
Word, and v.14 says that "The Word be-
came flesh." 

The Gospel calls our Lord "The Word," 
and says, "In Him was life" (ch.l: 1,4) . 
The Epistle unites the expressions, "The 
Word" and "Life," and calls Him "The 
Word of Life" (ch.l: 1) . 

In His Person and life on earth was 
manifested "that eternal life which was 
with the Father," i.e., having the character 
that it had with the Father in eternity (1 
John 1: 2) . "In Him as it were heaven 
was brought down to earth into the midst 
of desolation and death caused by the 
creature's sin." 

III. The Word of God 
As "The Word of God," our Lord Jesus 

Christ expresses God in righteous judg-
ment. The name is one of four given to 
the Majestic Rider on a white horse, 
righteous Judge and Warrior, in Rev.19: 
11-16. 

"0 magnify the Lord with me, and let 
us exalt His name together" (Psa.36: 3) . 

The Incomparable Christ 
By NEIL FRASER, Detroit 

Undoubtedly, the supreme person of 
the ages is Jesus Christ. He has literally 
changed the face of the earth and given a 
new direction to the history of mankind. 
We compute history by the number of 
years the event preceded or came after the 
Birth of Jesus. 

He has been gone well-nigh 1900 years, 
yet there are thousands of people who 
would gladly lay down their lives for His 
sake. He seems to cast a magnetic spell 
and to wield an unearthly power over the 
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hearts of multitudes today. They ascribe to 
Him glory, honor and worship as to a God. 
Nothing is too costly to lay at His feet; 
nor anything too hard to undertake for 
the sake of His name. 

With a single sentence, He has sent a 
multitude which no man can number, hur-
rying, scurrying, searching in every cor-
ner of the world. It has sent them to 
"Greenland's icy mountains" and to "In-
dia's sunny plains." It has urged them 
through trackless forests and infested 
swamps. They gladly spend and are spent 
for it. "Go ye into all the world and 
preach the gospel to every creature," he 
cried, and set the world in motion until 
the end of the age. 

He never did any of the five things that 
make for human greatness. He made no 
discovery of science; He wrote no book; 
He built no city; He effected no military 
conquests; He left behind Him no colossal 
fortune. These, these are the things that 
make men famous, but Jesus does none of 
them, yet leads the world. Without the 
learning of the schools, He has become the 
Teacher of the ages. The most majestic 
temples of earth stand in His honor. 

The great Napoleon said: "Alexander, 
Caesar, Charlemange, and I myself have 
founded great empires, but upon what did 
these erections of our genius depend? Upon 
force. Jesus alone founded His empire 
upon love, and to this very day, millions 
would die for Him. I think I understand 
something of human nature, and I tell you 
all these were men, and I am a man. Jesus 
Christ was more than man. I have inspired 
multitudes with such an enthusiastic de-
votion that they would have died for me; 
but to do this it was necessary that I 
should be visibly present with the electric 
influence of my looks, of my words, of my 
voice. Christ alone has succeeded in so 
raising the mind of man towards the un-
seen that it becomes insensible to the bar-
riers of time and space. 

"Across a chasm of 1800 years, Jesus 
Christ makes a demand which is, beyond 
all others, difficult to satisfy. He asks for 
the human heart; He will have it entirely 
to Himself. He asks it unconditionally and  

forthwith this demand is granted. Won-
derful! In defiance of time and space, the 
soul of man, with all its powers and facul-
ties, become an annexation to the empire 
of Christ. All who believe in Him experi-
ence that remarkable supernatural love 
toward Him. This phenomenon is unac-
countable; it is altogether beyond the 
reach of man's creative powers. Time, the 
great destroyer, is powerless to extinguish 
this sacred flame; time can neither ex-
haust its strength nor put a limit to its 
range. This is it which proves to me quite 
convincingly the Divinity of Jesus Christ." 

Great words from a great man! 
Let us consider Him for a few mo-

ments. He comes and presumes to forgive 
sins. He comes, and proclaims himself a 
lawgiver with a right to promulgate a 
higher moral law than that of Sinai. He 
comes, and announces Himself ruler in the 
Kingdom of God. He declares He will be 
the Judge of all mankind. He claims to 
bestow eternal life. He accepts worship. 
Peter refuses it. Paul refuses it. The an-
gel refuses it in Revelation, but Jesus ac-
cepts it, and when one of ten men comes 
back to thank Him for a miraculous cure, 
He cries: "Where are the nine? There are 
not found that returned to give glory to 
God save this stranger." He puts Himself 
on equality with the other members of the 
Godhead in giving the great commission. 

What do we think of Christ? If you 
admit, as all reputable critics now admit, 
that Jesus was a wise and a good man, 
then you must admit His full Deity. If He 
was a wise man, He would not have been 
so foolish as to make such an absurd and 
egotistical claim unless He was divine, and 
if, on the other hand, He was a good man, 
He would not have sought to mislead and 
delude His fellows by a claim so mon-
strous and blasphemous unless it was true. 

Did God send an innocent creature to 
die for others in order that He (God) 
might be loved? It would make Him un-
worthy of being loved. 

Did God allow a creature to capture 
the hearts of a multitude which no man 
can number, and center these affections in 
himself, a man? Then He has sanctioned 
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treason against His own throne. We love 
the One who died for us. 

But did all the fulness of the Godhead 
dwell in Him? Did He give up of his alti-
tude and veil His plentitude? Did He die 
and rise again, and ascend to the bosom of 
the father? Then He has taken the love 
and affection of His people back to God 
where it rightly belongs. God, in Christ, 
has reconciled the world unto Himself. 

What think ye of Christ? 

Our Risen Lord 
By GEORGE RAINEY, New York 

John 20. 
There is something everlastingly inspir-

ing about the Resurrection of our Lord. 
The first time the evangel was heard by 
His disciples it brought great joy. It is 
true that some of them doubted, for the 
first followers of Christ, like His own to-
day, had their doubts. However little by 
little the mists of doubt disappeared in the 
many infallible proofs of convincing evi-
dence. They saw Him and fear vanished. 
They touched Him and faith triumphed. 
They heard Him and love conquered. And 
as they saw His pierced hands and riven 
side peace swept into their souls and they 
went out into a hostile world proclaiming 
to all men the Resurrection Gospel. 

The story is told of a great English 
preacher who, towards the end of his life, 
began to ask God to forgive something for 
which he had never asked forgiveness be-
fore. He asked God to forgive him of the 
sin of gloom. His face had been gloomy 
and his voice had been gloomy. He felt as 
if he wanted God to forgive him for all the 
gloom in times past that had brought a 
shadow into his life; and God answered 
his prayer because one Lord's day morn-
ing as he was getting ready for his serv-
ices, there flashed upon him, with a new 
light, and an altogether new meaning, the 
glorious truth—Jesus Christ is alive. It 
simply thrilled him and in the glory of 
that risen life he went out to preach, and 
in the joy of that Easter Sunday morning 
vision he lived ever afterwards; not only 
on Easter but every Lord's day as long as 

he lived, the congregation sang, 
"Christ the Lord Is Risen Indeed." 

The world today seems to be under a 
heavy cloud of gloom. Its many problems 
seem insoluable, its difficulties invincible, 
its confusions hopeless. The message men 
want is a message of hope that will inspire 
courage and bring cheer. "Give us," they 
say, "a faith that will lift us into triumph 
when poverty and trouble assail us." Thank 
God we, as His redeemed children, have 
that message that all men need and it is 
the only message; it is that we live in the 
everlasting life of our Risen Lord. Because 
He lives we live also. When the conscious-
ness enters our hearts as a new conviction 
that the Lord Jesus Christ really lives to-
day and that He is not entombed in the 
oblivion of some Eastern grave, life in 
Christ is experienced on a higher plane. 
The dynamic of the Risen Redeemer trans-
forms and illuminates. 

We have read of that Moslem who was 
brought before the judge for reading the 
Bible. Before judgment was passed he 
begged to be allowed to ask a question. 
"I am travelling, I look round for some 
direction and discover two men; one is 
dead, the other alive. Which of the two 
am I to ask for advice—the dead or the 
living?" "Oh, the living of course" they all 
cried out. "Well," he added, "why require 
me to go to Mahomet, who is dead, instead 
of Christ Jesus, who is alive?" 

Today we believe, worship, love, and 
serve not a Savior who was alive and is 
dead, but a Savior who was dead and 
now lives at God's right hand. All praise 
be unto our Father in heaven! Jesus 
Christ is alive for evermore. Well might 
we remember this in these difficult days. 
It will give us new energy for service and 
fill our hearts with gladness and transform 
our lives to joy. May we apply to ourselves 
the Gospel of the Resurrection. It will turn 
our souls to singing and our lips to praise. 
We will face the unknown future with a 
radiant peace. The best is still before us. 
Let us sing again and again our song of 
victory, "JESUS CHRIST IS RISEN 
TODAY." 

In the melody of that sublime song let 
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all bitterness die; let strife be hushed; let 
all who love our soon-coming Lord in sin-
cerity and truth join hands and voices in 
bringing the poor unsaved in this sad 
world to realize that eternal rest and joy 
is found alone in a Risen Christ. 

Jesus lives, giving peace for sadness, 
Our sins are gone,His sweet name adore! 

Jesus lives, filling hearts with gladness, 
This anthem sing, till we cross the shore. 

Beautiful Feet 
By WILLIAM HILL, Canada 

1. Luke 15: 22, "Bring forth the best 
robe and put it on him." So the prodigal 
was clothed. Afterwards he went into the 
father's house, but he went in clothed in 
that which came out of the house. His 
position is ours: we too are shortly going 
in to the Father, but we are going in 
clothed in Divine Righteousness. It first 
comes out to us, and we take it with us. 
"Put a ring on his hand"—the ring is the 
symbol of love, not our love to Him but 
His love to us. A ring has neither begin-
ning nor end. "I have loved with an ever-
lasting love: therefore with lovingkind-
ness have I drawn thee" (Jer. 31: 3) . 
"And shoes on his feet." The feet stand 
symbolically for the walk, behavior. Up 
to this point the prodigal had been walk-
ing a self chosen path, wasting blessings 
bestowed in riotous living. But now the 
feet were shod. The power of grace comes 
out where previously only nature's ways 
were seen. 

2. Eph.6: 15—"And your feet shod with 
the preparation of the Gospel of peace." 
Shod, not only to walk the courts of the 
Father's house, but also to hasten the gos-
pel on its conquering way. Not just to run 
to tell the message, but to live it out in the 
terms of human life, that men may hear 
the "joyful sound" and see its transform-
ing power coming out in the feet. 

3. "How beautiful are thy feet with 
shoes, 0 prince's daughter" (Songs 7: 1) . 
Not just beautiful feet, but feet with shoes. 
Not the beauty of nature, but the beauty 
of grace. This is adorning-the doctrine of 
God our Savior. Confirming and empha- 

sizing the power of the gospel by the right 
foot and the left. 

4. "How beautiful are the feet of them 
that preach the gospel of peace that bring 
glad tidings of good things" (Rom.10: 15) . 
Here God links the beautiful feet and the 
beautiful message together. There must 
be no disparity between the message and 
the messenger. The preacher must have 
beautiful feet. 

5. "How beautiful upon the mountains 
are the feet of him that bringeth good tid-
ings" (Isa.52: 7) . The Father's house speaks 
of nearness, the mountains speak of dis-
tance. We must walk in holiness with the 
Father—as robed, ringed and shod, before 
we are allowed to take the message of 
salvation across the mountains. Only those 
who enjoy the near place in communion 
are sent afar with the message of recon-
ciliation. Such have beautiful feet, beauti-
ful with shoes. 

If We Were Really Looking 

If we were really looking 
For the coming of the Lord, 

I'm sure we'd seek more fully 
To obey His precious Word; 

To walk more closely to Him 
And His dear reproach to bear, 

If we were really looking 
For that meeting in the air. 

If we were really looking 
For His promised, glad return, 

Our hearts with love and longing 
For that day would always yearn. 

And, too, we would be seeking 
Each precious hour to buy, 

If we were really looking 
For His coming in the sky. 

If to this precious promise 
His own were wide awake, 

And we were really watching, 
What a difference it would make. 

'Twould cleanse and purify us, 
We readily can see, 

Were we watching for His coming 
Just the way we ought to be. 

—Edith M. Bennett, Youngstown, 0. 
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Four Eternal Things 
By J. SCROGGIE, Denver 

if 
. For the things which are seen are 

temporal; but the things which are not 
seen are ETERNAL" (2 Cor.4: 18) . Read 
the connection and notice the afflictions 
which Paul endured and yet he was 
buoyed up with the fact that the "Light 
affliction which is but for a moment, work-
eth for us a far more exceeding and ETER-
NAL weight of Glory." In a world full of 
disappointments and uncertainties and 
where everything is passing and trans-
ient, it is grand to look away from our-
selves and our circumstances to the pre-
cious Word of God and see some of the 
real treasures we possess in Christ Jesus. 
To be burdened with an ETERNAL 
weight of glory is very much different 
from being burdened with the loss of tem-
poral possessions; bank failures; unem-
ployment; etc. Perhaps it has taken the 
unfavorable worldly conditions to make 
some of us realize that the things which 
are seen ARE temporal. Here are some 
ETERNAL things which should wean, our 
hearts and minds from the 'toys' of earth 
and give us cause for rejoicing in our 
ETERNAL possessions. 

(1) Christ has found 
Eternal Redemption 

for us (Heb.9: 12, N.T.) . It was not to be 
found in the blood of animal victims shed 
upon Jewish altars. That sufficed for a 
time and had to be repeated, but the pre-
cious blood of Christ is such, that its value 
can never be exhausted. 

(2) Paul's exhortation to Timothy was, 
"Lay hold on ETERNAL LIFE whereunto 
thou art called" (1 Tim.6: 12) . Do we have 
a tight grasp of the things of this life or 
are we laying hold of the "real" life (Roth-
erham) . We are promised 

Eternal Life 
on believing the Gospel, but the value of 
our appreciation and enjoyment of this 
life will surely be manifested in our tight 
grasp or light hold of things down here. 

(3) The poorest saint is richer than the 
unbelieving multi-millionaire. God has 
promised us an 

Eternal Inheritance. 
". . . that they which are called might re-
ceive the promise of ETERNAL INHERI-
TANCE" (Heb.9: 15) . The death of the 
testator assures the fulfilment of the tes-
tament and promise. Peter writes that it 
is an inheritance incorruptible, and unde-
filed, and that fadeth not away, reserved 
in heaven for you (1 Pet.1: 4) . There will 
be no deterioration or shrinkage of value. 

(4) The God of all Grace hath called 
us unto His 

"Eternal Glory" 
(1 Pet.5: 10) . As Paul contemplates this 
great prospect he is led to exclaim, ". . . 
and rejoice in the Hope of one day sharing 
God's Glory" (Rom.5: 2, WEYMOUTH) . Do 
you rejoice in this dear fellow Christian? 

Surely there is no reason to be depres-
sed with our circumstances, be they ever 
so void of temporal possessions, when we 
have such glorious truths clearly stated in 
the Word of God, that Word upon which 
we rest our salvation. The Lord help us 
to set our mind on the heavenly things, 
the things which ARE ETERNAL. 

Consideration for the Poor 
By WALTER SCOTT 

Consideration for the poor is a bound-
en duty at all times, for in both Testaments 
they are ever a recognized class (Deut.15: 
11; Mark 14: 7) . The struggle for life as 
the end approaches is becoming more 
acute. Rascality and honest poverty are 
on the increase. Socialism with its lies 
and delusions, aided by the mighty forces 
of superstition in the Church, and ration-
alism in the world, is creating a chaos of 
direst evil. Hence all are affected, all 
more or less breathe the pestilential va-
pors which only blight and corrupt. The 
race of Christian benevolent men and wo-
men is dying out; hence missionary and 
other societies are with greater difficulty 
than ever holding their own. The period 
into which we have entered is not char-
acterized by generosity. The panacea for 
human woe is solely to be found in the 
Gospel of Jesus Christ. Social ameliora-
tion only touches the surface of the great 
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open sore. The Gospel goes straight to 
the root, and offers salvation to the lost as 
God's free gift to all who believe on His 
Son. 

Let heart and hand be freely and gen-
erously opened to the poor and needy. 
Sternly rebuke improvidence and waste. 
Where such exists, persons after warning 
should be denied help. Let them suffer, it 
may bring them to their senses. We have 
not one particle of sympathy for the worth-
less and lazy. In our judgment there is 
far too much mere sentimental feeling. To 
the genuine poor our heart goes out in 
true sympathy. 

Give Generously, But Give Wisely, 
and do not pander to the loafer, the lazy, 
the drunkard. The sick, afflicted, the aged, 
the widow, and orphan demand our most 
thoughtful and kind consideration in word 
and deed. Do not give a tract nor advice 
to a starving man. Feed him, then speak 
to him. That was Jehovah's order of deal-
ing with Elijah (1 Kings 19: 5-8) . It was 
the Lord's way with the repentant Peter 
(John 21: 15) . 

All this and more which might be 
truthfully said, should lead to increased 
and deepening dependence on the Living 
God. The cattle on a thousand hills are 
His, and the resources and wealth of crea-
tion are under His hand. He miraculously 
sustained Elijah His servant, and the deso-
late widow of Zarephath (1 Kings 17) . He 
fed His people—probably upwards of two 
millions—daily for forty years (Exodus 
16) . Better still, He gave us His beloved 
and only begotten Son—the brightest and 
highest expression of His unwearied love 
(Rom. 8: 32) . 

A Study of the Epistle to 
the Galatians 

By JOHN BLOORE, Jersey City 

The One Gospel and the Manner of 
Its Communication 

The apostle immediately turns to the 
serious matter before him, that of the 
Galatians changing over to the Judaistic 
teaching. This was nothing less than an  

actual turning from God who had called 
them in Christ's grace. That at once char-
acterized the teaching to which they were 
giving adherence as utterly opposed to 
the mind of God. Calling is habitually re-
fered to God in the epistles, it is in Christ's 
grace as defining the instrumentality 
which makes the call possible and also the 
element or sphere in which what the call 
involves is made good to us. Thus it is 
His grace as displayed in giving Himself 
for us to bring us to God, and it is that 
grace as continued in its display by Him 
raised from the dead and in the glory, 
thus making sure to us the complete sal-
vation which is according to God's purpose 
and grace in Christ. This is fully made 
known in what is here called "the gospel 
of Christ," that is, the glad-tidings con-
cerning Him, of which He is the glorious 
subject. This thought appears emphasized 
by a later statement: "that I should an-
nounce Him as the glad tidings among 
the nations" (v.16, NEW TRANS.) and in an-
other place Paul speaks of "the gospel of 
God . . . concerning His Son" (Rom.1: 1-3) . 
Constantly the apostle lays emphasis upon 
this blessed person in connection with 
faith and every Christian blessing. Thus 
we learn what it means to be called in 
Christ's grace, and so to know the fellow-
ship of God's Son (1 Cor.1: 9) . 

Now that to which they were turning 
Paul refers to as "a different gospel"—one 
which in the light of his previous words 
must be utterly opposed to the gospel of 
Christ. Then is it another gospel? Is it 
gospel at all? No! for he immediately adds, 
"which is not another," there being only 
one and that the gospel which, as he says, 
"we preached unto you." Instead of this 
teaching being another gospel, it was in 
fact the enemy's effort to pervert the only 
true gospel, to pervert as effecting a com-
plete change. James 4: 9 illustratei the 
force of this word: "Let you laughter be 
turned (the same Greek word) to mourn-
ing." So solemnly serious is this matter 
that the apostle calls for a curse upon any 
who bring another gospel than that he had 
already made known (v.8) . He repeats 
his solemn judgment—"As we have said 
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before," that is, as I think, on his last 
visit when by telling them the truth about 
the teaching to which they were turning 
he appeared to become their enemy (ch. 
4: 16) , "so now (in this epistle) I say 
again," etc. 

Thus he strongly asserts the fact that 
there is only one gospel. Furthermore, he 
brings in some details as to its introduc-
tion which serve to emphasize its heavenly 
character. First, it would seem that he 
was charged with temporizing, but now he 
asks in view of what he has just declared 
do they think he is seeking to concilitate 
men or God, is he striving to please men? 
Nay, if he still sought to please men, he 
would not be Christ's bondservant. If his 
aim and course in life were the fornier, he 
certainly would not be found preaching 
Him as God's glad tidings. Such an object 
would not be compatible with service for 
Christ who was rejected by man, but ac-
cepted by God who gave witness to this in 
His resurrection. Such service it would 
be folly to choose if his aim was to please 
men. Did they not know that "the word of 
the cross is to them that are perishing 
foolishness" (1 Cor.1: 18) ? He follows this 
with a fourfold statement of considerable 
importance. 

(1) . The gospel is not after, or accord-
ing to, man. It is not such as man would 
have made, it does not conform to his 
thoughts or ideas, not such as it would 
have been if of human origin. 

(2) . "Neither did I receive it from 
man." If such was not its character, nei-
ther did it proceed from man in the sense 
of him authenticating it or confirming it 
by conferred right or power to transmit it. 

(3) . "Nor was I taught it." Not only 
so, but the apostle had not been subject to 
instruction from man. 

These statements amplify v.1, and are 
further strengthened by vs.16,17 and ch. 
2: 6. 

(4) . "But it came to me through reve-
lation of Jesus Christ." This declares the 
real source of the gospel and indicates its 
true character. Christ revealed it to Paul. 
Thus he received it directly from the glori-
fied Christ. It is therefore connected with  

an entirely new order of life, relationship, 
and sphere of blessing—new creation. All 
is heavenly as to source and character. 
This in itself excludes law and its system 
of things. It makes Christ ALL as to source, 
object, life, and hope. 

The Servant's Induction 
Finally, the apostle speaks of his for-

mer place in the Jewish order of things. 
He then clearly intimates by recounting 
God's purpose in grace as to himself, that 
this purpose involved separation from the 
former to be identified with what was en-
tirely new and apart from the old. Flesh 
and blood had no part in this revelation, 
and evidently he adduces the fact of his 
sojourn in Arabia, and then his brief visit 
to Peter which was simply for the purpose 
of making his acquaintance, as evidence of 
his claims in respect to the gospel and his 
place in relation to it. He solemnly affirms 
this before God. 

The chapter closes with certain histori-
cal details to which we have already made 
brief reference. All show how entirely 
distinct was the place and ministry of Paul 
from any connection with Jewish sources, 
while also the assemblies in Judaea had 
acknowledged him and glorified God on 
his account. 

By these facts Paul shows that it was 
God who had called him out of the whole 
Jewish order when in fact he was in the 
most advantageous position possible in re-
lation to it, to reveal His Son in him and 
to preach Him as the glad tidings. How 
then could it be of God for them to turn 
to that very system of things for their per-
fecting in Christian place and blessing? 
Could they not see that this nullified the 
claims of that to which they were so eager-
ly turning, that in truth it was a turning 
from God who had called them in Christ's 
grace? 

"Study to show thyself approved unto 
God;" for God's approbation is abundant 
compensation for all men's condemnation 
or mis-representation, but there is no com-
pensation for God's condemnation. 

—Jas. McKendrick. 
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1 	The Bible Students Page 
By W. E. VINE, M. A. 

Notes on Romans 
Verse 22. thou that sayest a man should 

not committ adultery, dost thou commit 
adultery?—including a reference to the 
sin mentioned in Matt.19:8,9. The great 
vindication of the faith is a holy life. 

thou that abhorrest idols,—the Jews had 
been taught, by the severe discipline of 
the Captivity, to obey God's decrees against 
idolatry. The nation had been purged 
from its grossness in this respect, and so 
the Jew learned to share the Divine de-
testation of idols. 

dost thou rob temples?—hierosuleo, to 
commit sacrilege. See the corresponding 
noun in Acts 19:37. The fact that the town 
clerk at Ephesus cleared Paul of the charge, 
is sufficient to show that it was one likely 
to be brought against a Jew. The treas-
ures of the idol temples perhaps attracted 
the avarice of the Jews, who would excuse 
themselves on the score of the wickedness 
of idolatry. Possibly the reference is to 
the dishonor done by the Jews in making 
God's Temple in Jerusalem a place of mer-
chandise, and so worshipping Mammon in 
His very presence. Yet the fact that the 
Gentiles blasphemed the name of God be-
cause of the Jews (v.24) , points to the 
former explanation. 

Verse 23. thou who gloriest in the law, 
—lit., "in law," suggesting that, while the 
Law of Sinai is in view, yet the Jew made 
much of it merely as a matter of law, add-
ing his tradition to it. The phrase thus 
stands in contrast to those that follow, 
in which the article is used. 

through thy transgression of the law-
parabasis, lit., 'a stepping over the mark,' 

dishonourest thou God? —explained in 
the next verse. Each word, "dishonour-
est" and "God," bears stress in the original. 
Cp. the Lord's words to the Jews, in John 
8:49. 

Verse 24. For the name of God is blas-
phemed among the Gentiles because of 
you, even as it is written.—The quotation  

is from the Septuagint of Isaiah 52:5. See 
also Ezek.36:23. Isaiah, Ezekiel, Paul, all 
declare that with the people of God His 
character and honor are at stake, opinion 
of Him on the part of others being formed 
from the condition and conduct of those 
who own His Name. The Captivity of Is-
rael and Judah, consequent upon their 
sins, caused the Gentiles to scoff at God. 
The utterance in Isaiah had, then, a pro-
phetic application to the normal conditions 
of the Jews in the apostle's time. 

(b) The Appointment of Circumcision Is 
No Argument Against God's Im- 

partiality (vs. 25-29). 

Introductory Note 
The subject of circumcision is now 

taken up by way of contrast to the sins of 
the Jews as mentioned. Circumcision must 
be viewed from the Divine standpoint, and 
not as the Jew sees it. This leads on to 
the position of the Gentile who seeks to 
fulfil the Law. In verses 1-16, the apostle 
had shown that Jews and Gentiles would 
be judged according to their works; in 
verses 17-24, that the Jews were as guilty 
as the Gentiles. Now therefore (vs.25-29) 
Jews are equally liable to judgment, and 
righteous Gentiles will condemn them. 

Verse 25. For circumcision—the seal 
of God's covenant with Abraham and his 
descendants, and therefore another token, 
besides the Law, of the special privileges 
which were granted to the Jew and in 
which they gloried. 

indeed profiteth,—see 3:1. The posi-
tion of a circumcised Jew was superior to 
that of an uncircumcised Gentile, granted 
that the Jew kept the Law. 

if thou be a doer of the law: —not im-
plying the absolute fulfilment of every 
commandment, but a sincere endeavour 
to live in conformity to the Law. Circum-
cision would profit all who lived like that. 
The apostle is not here speaking of the 
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failure of the Jew to obtain life through 
the impossibility of keeping the Law, but 
of the real advantage derived from walk-
ing according to the Law. 

but if thou be a transgressor of the law, 
thy circumcision is become uncircumcision. 
—Here, again, the reference is to a habit 
of life and not a condition resulting from 
a breach of one point of the Law. For a 
Jew to live as a transgressor of the Law 
practically put him into the position of a 
Gentile. 

Verse 26. If therefore the uncircum-
cision—This carries the argument a step 
further and views the subject from the 
standpoint of a Gentile, who seeks to 
spend his life in conformity with what he 
knows to be right in the sight of God. 

keep the ordinances of the law,—not 
referring to sinless obedience, but to an 
effort to act rightly according to the dic-
tates of conscience, and so practically ac-
cording to the Law of God. See Acts 10:35. 
The word phullasso, "to keep," suggests 
the assiduous care of one who is guarding 
something. 

shall not his uncircumcision be reckon-
ed—This is perhaps set in contrast to what 
was said at the beginning of the chapter 
as to the Jew's reckoning regarding his 
own condition; see v.3. The self-consti-
tuted judge was practising what he con-
demned in others. Did he reckon to escape 
God's judgment? That was a false reckon-
ing. God is true, His reckoning is unerr-
ing and just, and the Apostle compels an 
answer from the Jew in recognition of the 
fact. 

for circumcision?—i.e., as equivalent of 
circumcision. The value of an ordinance 
is to be measured by the moral end at 
which it aims. 

Verse 27. and shall not the uncircum-
cision which is by nature,—referring to 
the condition of the Gentiles, which is the 
outcome of circumstances incident to na-
ture, in contrast to external influences 
such as the Law given to the Jews. See 
Ga1.2:15, "Jews by nature." 

if it fulfil the law,—cp. the case of 
Cornelius. 

judge thee,—krinO here denotes "to 

pronounce sentence upon." Compare the 
teaching of the Lord about the men of 
Nineveh and the queen of the South, Matt. 
12:41,42, where, however, katakrinO, "to 
condemn" is used. Stress is thrown upon 
each word, "judge" and "thee," by its 
position in the sentence. An alternative 
reading is "and the circumcision which is 
by nature, fulfilling the law, shall judge 
thee." The ordinary text is to be preferred. 

who with the letter and circumcision- 
i.e., with the letter of the law before him, 
and in the enjoyment of the covenant re-
lationship involved in circumcision. The 
"letter" suggests the possession of the 
written commandments of the Law, a priv-
ilege indeed, but rendered worse than val-
ueless by wilful transgression of the Law. 

art a transgressor of the law?—para-
bates; see note on verse 23. 

Verse 28. For he is not a Jew,—for the 
significance of the term see verse 17. 

which is one outwardly;—that is to say, 
his condition is due not to physical and 
racial privileges. 

neither is that circumcision, which is 
outward in the flesh:—The distinctive fea-
ture implied in spiritual circumcision can-
not be determined by natural circum-
stances. God looks on the heart. Nothing 
external constitutes spiritual relationship 
to him. 

Gems of Truth from the 
Revised Version 

By ROBERT LEE 
Author of Outlined Bible, etc. 

Why the Ungodly Cannot Walk Straight 
"The way of him that is laden with 

guilt is exceeding crooked"—Prov.21: 
8, R.V. 

Just so. What else could we expect? 
How is it possible for one staggering un-
der a heavy load to walk straight? 

This is an age that thinks little of doc-
trine but a great deal about practice. It 
admires, and indeed insists upon straight 
living. Yet it does not practice what it 
demands. How is this? Not through lack of 
effort. Man can learn most things by prac- 
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tice and experience. Practice makes per-
fect. But this is not so in the matter of 
Christian living. Think of the futile though 
desperate attempts made by multitudes 
from time to time to live straight. Why 
the failure? 

There are four reasons why the un-
saved cannot walk straight. (1) He bears 
a load of guilt. All are thus burdened 
though not all are conscious of that fact. 
"How camest thou by the burden at first?" 
inquired Evangelist of Christian in "Pil-
grim's Progress." "By reading this Book 
(the Bible) in my hand," was the reply. 
It is a load that is daily increasing, and is 
constantly being added to by crooked 
ways. How are we to get rid of this bur-
den? Not by trying to walk straight. Yet 
that lies behind many attempts to be good 
and to do good. That is impossible, as 
Prov.21: 8, R.V. shows. Only at the Cross 
can we be released from it. There the 
burden rolls away. He is the Lamb of 
God taking away the sin of the world. 
(2) He has a crooked nature. In the game 
of Bowls, the "Woods" have a bias, i.e., 
are each weighted at only one end, there-
fore they will not run straight. By nature 
there is a bias in us toward evil, this makes 
"going straight" impossible apart from 
Grace. How could the way of the poor 
woman in Luke 13:11 but be exceedingly 
crooked? How can we with the twist in 
our nature walk straight? But He can 
make the crooked path straight, and then 
the way of such will be right. If I am 
delivered from my burden of guilt through 
gazing at the Cross, I am delivered from 
the twist in my nature by Christ impart-
ing His life, and strength, and grace. (3) 
He has crooked ideals. He takes his pat-
tern from the valley instead of from the 
mount; his ideals are like himself, crooked 
ones. How different is it with the Lord's 
own. "I have set the Lord always before 
me" is the testimony of the believer. (4) 
Then he is weary as well as heavy laden. 
What awful weariness of soul comes 
through bearing the burden of guilt. And 
tired people usually walk crooked. 

Thus to walk straight I need to know 
the Lord as my Sin Bearer, as Healer, as 

Rest-giver, and Model. May He become 
all this to you! 

Gospel Studies 
By FRED J. SQUIRE, Boston 

Isaiah 53: 3—". . . a man of sorrows, and 
acquainted with grief . . ." 

I. Sorrow and Trouble Inevitable 
There are not many of us that are not 

in some degree "acquainted with grief." 
Grief and sorrow and tears do not consti-
tute life by any means, but they are very 
important factors in it, and influence our 
lives to a considerable extent. Some sor-
rows are the reaping of our own deliberate 
sowing. 

Sorrow is the shadow of sin. Sin ulti-
mately produces sorrow and it is not only 
the sinner that suffers, but very often 
others. When God pronounced the judg-
ment of sorrow upon our first parents, He 
only announced the result of their own sin. 
Gen.3: 16,17—"In sorrow thou shalt bring 
forth children . . ." "In sorrow thou shalt 
eat of the ground . . ." 

We may deny the fall of man, but we 
cannot deny the sorrow which resulted 
from it. 

Sin lies at the root of all our griefs. It 
is the first cause of all suffering. One of 
the great objects of men today is to banish 
sorrow. Hence all the world's efforts to 
create a smile and to amuse. But such are 
vain remedies for sorrow. Worldly amuse-
ments only touch the surface. Prov.14: 10, 
"The heart knoweth his own bitterness . . ." 
Prov.25: 20, "As he that taketh away a gar-
ment in cold weather, . . . so is he that 
singeth songs to an heavy heart." 

O the questions we should like to have 
answered on the problems of suffering! 
If the Old Book doesn't give us any light, 
I'm afraid we shall ask in vain. Sorrow is 
an unwelcome reality. People are willing 
to die in order to get rid of their sorrows. 
But are you sure you will get something 
better at death? You may, but only in 
Christ. Very definitely not so if you are 
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out of Christ. "Ye shall die in your sins . . ." 
The sins you have retained here you will 
retain there. If you are ever to be de-
livered from sorrow, it must be this side 
of the grave. 

The Word of God closely associates sin 
and sorrow. God's answer to the problem 
of sorrow is to save men from the cause of 
it—sin. We love the sin, but hate its con-
sequence—sorrow. Sin causes grief not 
only to man but to God. Gen.6: 5,6, ". . . 
evil continually . . . and it grieved Him at 
His heart." Isa.53: 4, ". . . He hath borne 
our griefs." Luke 19: 41-44, ". . . He be-
held the city, and wept over it." Eph.4: 30, 
"Grieve not the Holy Spirit of God." 

As we prefer sin and self-pleasing, so 
we choose sorrow and grief. It always re-
sults in these things. The man who seeks 
enjoyment in the pleasures of sin is sow-
ing for himself a crop of sorrow. The har-
vest is certainly coming. Ga1.6: 7, "Be not 
deceived: God is not mocked: for whatso-
ever a man soweth, that shall he also reap." 
Psa.32: 10, "Many sorrows shall be to the 
wicked . . ." How can that which grieves 
God produce anything else but sorrow to 
man? A man of sin deserves to be a man 
of sorrows. He may not be here, but he 
surely will be hereafter. 

II. The Man of Sorrows 
Here is One of whom it is said that He 

was separate from sinners—"that in Him 
is no sin," yet was "a man of sorrows and 
acquainted with grief." "Man of Sorrows, 
what a name!" 

And what sorrow! Lam. 1: 12, "Is it 
nothing to you, all ye that pass by?" Why 
should He be afflicted? "Surely He hath 
borne our griefs and carried our sorrows!" 
Psa.102: 8-10, "For I have eaten ashes like 
bread, and mingled my drink with weep-
ing." 
"For me it was in the garden He prayed, 

`Not My will, but Thine'; 
He had no tears for His own griefs, 

But sweat drops of blood for mine." 
Ezek.33: 11, "As I live, saith the Lord God, 
I have no pleasure in the death of the 
wicked . . ." Calvary is the proof of this. 
Exodus 3: 7, ". . . I know their sorrows." 
He knew; He knows. 

III. God Does Not Seek Pity for His Son 
Calvary was a necessity. He seeks 

obedience and faith. Definite personal 
acknowledgment of sin and reception of 
the Lord Jesus Christ as Sinbearer and 
Savior. Will you accept Christ personal-
ly now and here? Psa.51: 9-10, "Hide Thy 
face from my sins, and blot out all mine 
iniquities." Luke 15—"There is joy." Be-
fore you can know the joy of His salvation 
you must be saved. "I do believe. I will 
believe that Jesus died for me." 

IV. The Joy of the Lord 
is a very real thing. It is of God. The 
world cannot give it, take it away, or un-
derstand it. John 15: 11, ". . . that My joy 
might remain in you, and that your joy 
might be full." Even the world's sorrows 
cannot stamp it out. Sin is the only thing 
that interferes with it. Unconfessed sin re-
sults in lack of joy. Who should not be 
joyful when his sins are forgiven and he 
enjoys peace with God? 1 Thess.5: 16, "Re-
joice evermore." Isa.61: 3, ". . . beauty for 
ashes . . . garment of praise for the spirit 
of heaviness . . ." 

Killjoys? No! The world's joys don't 
need killing, they are dead already and 
only satisfy dead people. The joy of the 
Lord is a living joy. Not perpetually smil-
ing in the face of the world's tears. Isa. 
43:2, "When thou passest through the 
waters, I will be with thee . . ." Isa.35: 10, 
"Songs and everlasting joy, sorrow, sigh-
ing shall pass away." Rev.21: 4, "God shall 
wipe away all tears from their eyes; and 
there shall be no more death, neither sor-
row, nor crying." Psa.16: 11, ". . . In Thy 
presence is fulness of joy; at Thy right 
hand there are pleasures for evermore." 

V. Reject Christ 
and you must partake of that sorrow that 
He died to save you from. Luke 13: 28, 
"There shall be weeping and gnashing of 
teeth." No laughter there. The sorrow of 
remorse! Be warned! 

"The look of faith to Jesus Christ on 
the cross, brings life." "The look of faith 
to Jesus Christ on the throne, maintains 
life."—Selected. 
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The Young Believers Page 

First Steps 
By FREDK. A. TATFORD 

The Lord's Supper 
It was an ancient practice among the 

Jews, after the death of a wife or a parent, 
to break bread and to drink wine in re-
membrance of the departed loved one. 
When Ezekiel suffered the bereavement of 
his wife, for example, he was commanded 
to "eat not the bread of men" (Ezek.24: 
17) as a token of mourning, and in Jer.16: 
7 again, the prophet declared that men 
should not "tear themselves" ("break 
bread" reads the margin of the Newberry 
Bible) for deceased parents, nor should 
men give to the bereaved "the cup of con-
solation to drink for their father or for 
their mother." (See also Hosea 9: 4.) 

The perpetuation of this ancient cus-
tom in the ordinance of the Lord's Supper 
is therefore of singular and touching sig-
nificance. 

It was the night of our Lord's betrayal, 
and as He gathered His own around Him, 
it was with the conscious knowledge that 
He was soon to be taken from them. Long-
ing for their love and continued remem-
brance, but knowing how easily the hu-
man heart would forget, He assumed the 
place of a near relation and, taking up the 
old custom, converted it into a divine or-
dinance. 

In the institution of this divine feast of 
remembrance, however, Christ imparted a 
far deeper meaning to the symbols than 
was ever conveyed by the formal loaf and 
cup of the Jewish mourner. To the Jew, 
the elements were merely necessary ad-
juncts but, in the Christian ordinance, they 
become the expressive types of the body 
and blood of Christ. As the Lord Jesus 
divided the loaf among His disciples, He 
declared, "This is My body, which is given 
for you: this do in remembrance of Me," 
and as He poured out the cup, He said, 
"This cup is the new testament in My  

blood, which is shed for you" (Luke 22: 
19,20) . The words, of course, contain no 
thought of transubstantiation or consub-
stantiation, but are merely the plain state-
ment of the spiritual significance of the 
appointed symbols. 

The Roman Catholic church, in the 
doctrine of transubstantiation, teaches that 
by consecration, the sacramental elements 
are actually converted into the physical 
body and blood of Christ, and that the par-
taking of the feast involves literally the 
eating of the flesh and drinking of the 
blood of Christ. The Lutheran church, on 
the other hand, in the doctrine of consub-
stantiation, teaches that, at consecration, 
in some mysterious way, the flesh and 
blood of Christ are brought into union 
with the bread and wine. The fallacy of 
both doctrines is obvious. When our Lord 
declared, "This is My body," He was ac-
tually present in the physical body, and it 
is quite clear that the disciples did not par-
take then of the natural flesh and blood. 
On the other hand, as Bishop How points 
out, "if it be said that Christ's body is now 
a spiritual body, and that, therefore, what 
could not be then, can be now, this is to 
deny that the apostles at that time partook 
of the real sacrament." 

The real explanation is to be found in 
the Lord's own discourse on the bread of 
life (John 6) , where He definitely declared 
that, apart from eating His flesh and drink-
ing His blood, life was impossible. (That 
the material flesh and blood are not indi-
cated is made clear in John 6:63.) In 1 
Cor.10: 16 also, the apostle Paul explained 
that the cup and the loaf represented the 
communion of (or participation in) the 
blood and body of Christ. The question is 
one entirely of fellowship and identifica-
tion with Christ. Spiritually—and only 
spiritually—the believer feeds upon Him, 
and the vitality and power of the spiritual 
life are entirely dependent upon that feed-
ing. 

The full beauty of the type is irretriev- 
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ably lost when, as in the Roman Catholic 
church, the cup is denied to the laity. 
Body and blood, bread and wine, were 
both bestowed and, in the denial of one, 
the other loses any significance it had. 

It is evident from Acts 2: 41, 42 that 

The Sole Qualification for Partaking 
of the Lord's Supper is a personal belief 
in Christ as Savior. Neither ignorance 
nor inexperience can be regarded as a bar-
rier, and unless there is a disorderly walk 
or a heretical belief, it is the responsibility 
of every believer to avail himself of the 
opportunity of remembering His beloved 
Lord. Obviously no unbeliever can have 
any part in the feast: such an one has 
nothing either to remember or to mourn. 
But to the believer, the feast is ever the 
tangible reminder of a loved One who has 
gone. 

In Jehovah's dealings with Israel, the 
seventh day of the week was set aside as 
the sabbath, or hallowed day of rest. The 
characteristic day of Christianity, how-
ever, is the first day of the week. The  

resurrection of Christ occurred on the first 
day of the week; the descent of the Holy 
Spirit and the baptism of Pentecost took 
place on the first day of the week; and 
from the earliest days of the church's his-
tory, the first day has been set aside as the 
Lord's day. It was accordingly on the first 
day of the week that the disciples came 
together to break bread (Acts 20: 7) , and 
the apostolic practice has been continued 
to this day. 

The place of gathering, in the natural 
sense, has necessarily an earthly location, 
since the physical body is limited to earth. 
From a spiritual point of view, however, 
the gathering should be in the heavenlies 
around Christ Himself—transported from 
the scenes of earth by the Holy Spirit. 
Whilst we remember One who is absent, 
spiritually we find ourselves in His pres-
enCe. Moreover, He definitely declares of 
the gatherings of His people, "Where two 
or three are gathered together in My name, 
there am I in the midst of them" (Matt. 
18:20) . 

(To be Continued in May) 

Notes on First Corinthians 
By A. N. O'BRIEN, Duluth 

Chapters Twelve and Thirteen 
The Apostle did not wish them to be 

ignorant concerning spiritual gifts, v. 1. 
They had been idolators, "carried away 
unto dumb idols," v.2. Thus their minds 
had been debased, but now they were 
Christians, and their minds had been 
cleansed and ennobled. They now knew 
Jesus, a living Savior. They were also in-
dwelt by the Holy Ghost. No man speak-
ing by the Spirit of God could wish a 
curse on the Lord Jesus, v.3. Nor could 
any man say "that Jesus is the Lord, but 
by the Holy Ghost," v.3. The practical 
owning of the Lordship of Christ, is by no 
means easy. Many used the word in His 
days among men (Matt.7;23,24; Luke 6; 
46) but they never really acknowledged 
Him in that relationship of control over 
them. We never read of Judas calling Him 

Lord. 
"Diversities," "differences," "diversities," 

in vs.4-6 are all the same word in the 
Greek. J.N.D. renders in each case "dis-
tinction." "Distinctions of gifts, but the 
same Spirit, distinctions of services, and 
the same Lord, distinctions of operations, 
but the same God Who operates all things 
in all." Some "manifestation of the Spirit" 
is given to each believer, v.7. By it he can 
serve his fellowsaints. Wisdom is not the 
same as knowledge—many intelligent men 
are not wise. So the gifts are distinguished, 
v.8. Wisdom has been described as "know-
ledge applied." Some can tell us where 
certain truths are to be found—others can 
show us how to apply them to our cir-
cumstances—this last is wisdom. "Faith," 
(v.9) is likely some special gift of faith. 
All saints have faith in Christ, so that is 
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not a special gift. Gifts of healing, proph-
ecy, discerning of spirits, tongues and in-
terpretation of tongues are all mentioned 
in the list, vs.9,10. The words "to one," 
and "to another" are important, for many 
teach now that all should speak in tongues. 
The gifts are by the Spirit, Who "divideth 
to every (each) man severally as He will," 
v.11. Thus the church is like to a human 
body, with different members, for varied 
services. In fact this figure is next em-
ployed "For as the body is one, and hath 
many members, and all the members of 
that one body, being many are one body; 
so also is (the) Christ," v.12. It will be 
noticed that the head and the members 
are here called "The Christ," for the def-
inite article is in the Greek. The Holy 
Ghost has produced this unity "for by (in) 
one Spirit are we all (we have all been) 
baptized into one body, whether we be 
Jews or Gentiles," v.13. The Holy Spirit 
unites all believers to Christ, in this one 
body—no mere professors are in it, for we 
"have all been made to drink into (of) one 
Spirit." 

"The body is not one member, but 
many," v.14. Foot, hand, ear, eye, nose, 
etc. make up the body, and "God hath set 
the members in the body as it hath pleased 
Him, vs.15-18. Not all one member, but 
many—yet one body, vs.19,20. No member 
can dispense with the others, v.21. "Feeble 
members are necessary," v.22. There are 
"less honorable" parts "of the body" and 
"uncomely parts," but "God hath tem-
pered the body together, having given 
more abundant honor to that part which 
lacked," vs. 23, 24. All this "that there 
should be no schism (division) in the body, 
but that the members should have the 
same care (concern) one for another," v. 
25. One member suffering, all suffer—if 
one receive honor, all rejoice, v.26. 

The church then is not an organization 
at all. It is an organism. There is a vast 
difference between these things. An or-
ganization is a voluntary society. Who-
ever wishes can join it, provided that 
those in it ahead of him will admit him. It 
is governed by officers and they are guided 
by articles of incorporation and by a con- 

stitution and bylaws. Men receive into it 
and put out from it. In spiritual things 
this is a sect. It cannot contain all the 
members of the body of Christ, but it does 
add to the few real Christians within its 
communion many unsaved men and wo-
men. It takes a name, but it cannot be de-
scribed by any name given by God to His 
people on earth. His names take in all 
true Christians, and no one else. But man 
cannot invent a name which is coextensive 
with the true church, and to apply a Bible 
name to less than what it stands for in the 
scriptures, is wrong, if not dishonest. 

An organism is a body instinct with 
life. The one chosen to illustrate the vital 
unity of the church is the human body. 
It is controlled by the head, not by a presi-
dent or a chairman. The life of the head 
flows through each member of the body. 
There is inter-dependence, mutual care 
and varied activity in a body. 

The application of all this begins in v. 
27, "Now ye are the body of Christ and 
members in particular." God, who set the 
members in the human body, has formed 
all believers into the body of Christ. Sure-
ly it becomes us to ask Him "What mem-
ber am I?" Have we ever given this ques-
tion any serious consideration? 

In that body God has set some prom-
inent members—apostles, prophets, teach-
ers. After that less important gifts, "mir-
acles (miraculous powers) , gifts of heal-
ings, helps (surely this is a more common 
gift—anyone can help) , governments, di-
versities (kinds) of tongues. Verses 29,30 
show that no one had all the gifts. The 
answer to the question in these verses 
must be in the negative. Note this well, 
for in our day, and in some quarters, the 
gift of tongues is reckoned the unfailing 
sign of the baptism (as it is called) of the 
Holy Ghost. Some, not all, had that gift in 
apostolic days, and the teaching in ques-
tion ignores the fact that when one be-
lieves the gospel he gets the Holy Ghost. 
See Acts 10;43,44 and the comment upon 
it in Acts 15;7,8. Acts 19;2, rightly trans-
lated says "Did ye receive the Holy Ghost 
when ye believed?" This can be seen by 
consulting the R.V. or J.N.D. or any literal 
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"Only acknowledge thine iniquity . . • and I will give you pastors according to mine heart" (Jer.3: 13,15) . 
3. "And Samuel Judged," v. 6— 

Godly Rule 
"When the Lord raised them up judges, Then the Lord was with the judge 
And delivered them," (Jud.2: 18) . 
Having led the people into the presence of God, the result of their confession is their restoration. Samuel becomes the link between God and His people. He acts on behalf of God, and rules as having the mind of God. 
Samuel is the last of the line of judges raised up by God for the deliverance and well being of a failing people. (See Jud.2: 18 and 1 Sam.12: 11.) That line is very sug-gestive as to what should characterize any who aspire to leadership amongst the Lord's people. Cf. Heb.13: 17. 

The first one, Othniel —"the lion of God"—speaks of the boldness and energy of faith required if one is to rule. 2 Tim. 

Deborah, the prophetess, dwelling un-der the shadow of the Almighty, could sit in judgment and arise a mother in Israel, and say "Hath not the Lord God of Israel commanded?" She had His mind and could communicate it. 
Gideon was in the secret of Israel's ab-ject condition (Jud.6: 13) , and entered into the secret of power (v.14) , for conscious weakness brings in omnipotence. 
Jephtah, "thrust out" and exiled, but sought for in a time of need (Jud.11: 5) , stands on a divine platform (vs.15-28) , and realizes divine power, v.29. 
In Samson we have Nazariteship—en-tire separation to God—a most important feature. 
Finally in Samuel as judge we have all these features linked together. 
As soon as Israel is restored to God the enemy is aroused. He ever will be when the people of God come together in true humiliation to supplicate before the Lord. But the people have learned the lesson of Mizpeh. Fear take‘ hold of +b.,. 
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Notes on First Samuel 
By PETER PELL, JR., Grand Rapids 

The Revival, 1 Sam. 7:2-17 

Twenty long years the ark abode in 

Kirjath-jearim. Dark days they were of 

departure and distance from God, but 

days in which God was making His ab-

sence felt in Israel, and by sorrowful 

chastening was winning them back again. 

Remembering brighter days, the people 

begin to lament after the Lord—the first 

evidence of a divine work in their souls 

and the necessary prelude to revival. 

"They shall come with weeping 

And with supplication will I lead them," 
Jer.31: 9. 

The record of the twenty years is lost—

the story of the day of repentance and 

recovery is the subject of our chapter. 

Instructive it will be to notice the sev-

enfold activity of Samuel, the man of 

On every hand the idols were torn down 

from their pedestals, and the Lord re-

ceived His true place in their hearts. 

No evil can be tolerated if we are to 

experience deliverance from the Lord. It 

must be HE ONLY or not at all. He will 

brook no rival, for real love is exclusive. 

He would draw His people to Himself and 

thus from idols. 

2. "And Samuel Said, Gather All Israel," 
v. 5—Priestly Ministry 

"Can the Lord but find thee emptied, 

That is all He seeks to find." 

Samuel gathers all Israel together to 

Mizpeh for prayer. Mizpah means "watch-

tower." The one who watches is God. We 

are under the divine eye. See Gen.31: 49. 

The bringing of Israel to Mizpeh would 

speak of fellowship—being in the light of 

His presence. 1 John 1: 6,7. 
What took place at Mizpeh is very sig-

nificant. 
First of all, we see the ready response 

to the call to waver, "they gathered to- 
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the call to battle, v.8. So those who spoke among the saints should give forth "words easy to be understood," or others would not know what was spoken; it would be to "speak into the air," unless comprehended by others, v.9. 
There are "many kinds of voices in the world," and, no doubt, all have significance, v.10. But if one knows not "the meaning of the -voice," he and the speaker are bar-barians to each other, v.11. So the breth-ren were to seek to excell in the edifying of the church, v.12. Therefore he who spoke in a tongue was to pray that he might interpret, v.13. Otherwise the spirit might pray, but the understanding would be unfruitful, v.14. The Apostle therefore would eschew the speaking in tongues, and use language which he, and others, could understand; the same principles also governed his singing, v.15. Unless this rule were observed, how could others say amen, at his giving of thanks, when they did not understand him, v.16. He might give thanks well, but the oth  
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likely no time limit was placed upon the meeting. Speaking in tongues was to be by not more than three persons, and "by course," as most likely they were in dan-ger of a less orderly method. If there was not an interpreter present, those who had the gift of tongues were to be altogether silent, vs.27,28. These two rulings would practically prohibit nearly all which goes under the description of speaking in tongues in our day. 

Two or three prophets might speak in one meeting—the rest were to judge, v.29. If another had a message from God, the one speaking was to give way, v.30. Thus all might speak and all would be taught and comforted, v.31. No one might pre-tend that he could not resist the impulse to minister, v.32. God is not the author of confusion, but of peace, in the churches, v.33. 

The total absence of the ordained min-ister in this view of the public activities of the church is 
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The Sunday School Corner 
Conducted by H. G. LOCKETT, M A 

Sunday School Notes 
By ARCHIBALD COUSINS, London 

This month we are giving an extract 
from the very interesting address given 
last month by Mr. H. Kingwell Saunders 
at Bloomsbury Chapel, London, on "The 
Christian in Service — In the Sunday 
School." We regret space will not permit 
of our giving a longer extract: 

"Will you take with me a journey to 
the Sunday School? We notice that each 
teacher is present and punctual, and, we 
trust, prepared. 

"And now the service commences. You 
are pleased with the singing. It is not the 
shouting of some go-ahead tune to words 
which are outside the compass of the chil-
dren's thoughts, but the music of hymns of 

ex ressed in youthful 

"The notices are given out and classes 
commence. 

"Looking back on the proceedings thus 
far, you feel that an earnest attempt has 
been made to make the service a real 
whole for the children, and not a matter of 
preliminaries which doesn't count much, 
followed by a lesson which matters every-
thing. 

"It so happens that a fresh scholar has 
come along on the occasion of your visit, 
and this is the first opportunity in the serv-
ice to show the new-comer special atten-
tion. This the Superintendent is now care-
ful to do. He takes down all necessary 
details, and the reason for corning being 
satisfactory, the new scholar is warmly 
welcomed and given a place in a suitable 
class. 

And as you look on at these proceed- 
and maybe the 



Savior, Out of the mouths of babes and 
sucklings thou hast perfected praise.' You 
notice, however, that the younger children 
have their work cut out to read the words 
quickly enough to sing them, and you 
wonder whether they have grasped much 
of their meaning and spirit. You are thank-
ful that the Superintendent, when opening 
with prayer, does not make you think that 
he is engaging in private prayer, nor yet 
that he is at the Assembly prayer meeting, 
but that he has been but the leader of the 
children and voiced what may be truly 
their praises and their needs. 

"After the second hymn a portion of 
Scripture is read, the children taking part, 
and here again you feel some misgiving as 
to the understanding of the younger ones, 
whose wrinkled brows, as they attempt to 
read, betray the effort they are making. 
The same thought is evidently in the mind 
of the Superintendent, for when giving out 
the third hymn he says, 'Now this is spec-
ially for the younger ones,' and some of 
the older scholars don't look overjoyed at 
being called on to sing a 'kids' hymn.  

lish schoolmasters, the great Dr. Arnold of 
Rugby, come to your mind—'Whenever a 
day comes when I can receive a boy into 
my school without emotion it will be time 
for me to be off.' 

"But more likely your thoughts go 
again to the Savior's words, 'Whoso shall 
receive one such little child in My name 
receiveth Me, and whosoever shall receive 
Me receiveth not Me but Him that sent 
me.' Yes, Christ in the closest imaginable 
way identifies Himself with the children, 
so that service and love for them are in 
truth service and love for Himself. If we 
had to deal with the child Jesus, how 
prayerful and loving and tender we should 
be in contact with His young life! This is 
how Jesus would have us approach all 
children. It is the warrant for the teach-
er's most consecrated devotion, and the 
guarantee of the glory and blessing of His 
service. It is a work uniquely acceptable 
in the Master's service. 

"And now the Superintendent, as you 
are a very special visitor, takes you for a 
few minutes to the infants' room, and on 



than all the Corinthians (v.18) but in the 
church he preferred to speak five words 
with his understanding, so as to teach oth-
ers, than ten thousand words in a tongue, 
v.19. He, at least, was entirely free from 
any desire to display himself. Alas this 
could hardly have been said of the Cor-
inthians. 

They were not to be children, playing 
with something which made themselves 
prominent. It was well to be children in 
malice, v.20. Tongues were for a sign to 
unbelievers, as the quotation from the Old 
Testament showed, vs.21,22. 

When, therefore, the whole church came 
together, if they all spoke with tongues, 
the unlearned and the unbelievers would 
say that they were mad, v.23. But if all 
prophesied, the consciences of such would 
be gripped, and they would acknowledge 
the presence and power of God, vs.23,24 
and 25. Therefore when they came togeth-
er, all things were to be done "unto edify-
ing," v.26. Probably the verse implies that 
they were too anxious to take part, though 

which means "ruler of the laity." In apos-
tolic times men qualified of God, and gift-
ed by Him taught the saints, with liberty 
for the Spirit to use whom He chose. Mod-
ern ecclesiasticism would call God's order 
confusion, but God never yet was mistaken. 

Woman's place is definitely assigned to 
her—silence in the churches. She is "not 
permitted to speak," but to be in obe-
dience, v.34. It will not do to suppose an 
unusual unfitness on the part of Corinth-
ian women for six good authorities omit 
"your." 1 Tim.2; 11-15 commands the same 
silence, and gives reasons for it. The Apos-
tle immediately demands that every one 
pretending to spirituality must acknow-
ledge his apostolic authority in the matter, 
v.37. Authority did not originate in Cor-
inth—it came to them, v.36. If any one was 
so grossly ignorant as not to bow to the 
apostle, he was given over to ignorance, v. 
38. They were to "covet to prophesy" and 
not to forbid speaking in tongues, v.39; 
and all things were to be done decently (in 
a comely manner) and with order, v.40. 



on any day when there is a distinct heart 
yearning after the Lord on the part of His 
people. 

1. "And Samuel Spoke," v.3— 
Prophetic Ministry 

"He sent His word 
And healed them," Psa.107: 20. 

In the work of restoration, the Lord 
uses the one who had learned to distin-
guish His voice and to understand His 
word. Twenty years in obscurity, but all 
the while a vessel meet for the Master's 
use, Samuel once more appears on the 
scene. His first activity is to bring the word 
of God to all Israel. He appeals to their 
consciences and to their hearts; warning 
them of their sad condition and of the bar-
riers between their souls and God, while 
he directs them to the only worthy object 
—the Lord Himself. 

What a need there is today for ministry 
as faithful, and fearless, and effective as 
Samuel's. It did not leave the hearers as 
they were; it wrought obedience in them.  

ing out before the Lord was the expression 
of their utter weakness and helplessness 
(Psa.22: 14); but it also expressed trust in 
the Lord, for although water spilt on the 
ground is a picture of weakness, (see 2 
Sam.14: 14), its being poured out before 
the Lord, brings in the hope of it being 
gathered up again. 

And then the whole day's fast, when 
the desires of nature were repressed and 
finally, the heartfelt confession of their 
sin, tell how thorough the self judgment 
was, and how real the restoration. 

To gather the people of God together is 
the calling of every true servant, and nev-
er was there greater need than in our day 
for being "drawn together after the Lord; " 
being brought under His eye to see things 
as He sees them. 

The need of revival is felt on every 
hand — the way to revival is so little 
known. What would not be the blessed 
results did the people of God come togeth-
er as Israel did, and confess, and fast, and 
pray at another Mizpeh. 



the two-edged dagger—symbol of the word 
of God with which one must be familiar if 
the foe is to be vanquished. Titus 1: 9. 

Shamgar's oxgoad would suggest Eccl. 
12: 10,11 and the effective use of the word 
of truth. Cf. 1 Cor.2: 4; 1: 27.  

in measure the value of prayer. mere is 
no calling for the ark; no shouting now. 
They say to Samuel, "Cease not to cry to 
the Lord our God for us that He will save 
us." 

(To be Continued) 

Notes on First Corinthians 
By A. N. O'BRIEN, Duluth 

church,v.4. There was no jealousy in Paul, 
he would rejoice if they all spake with 
tongues (v.5) but much more if they all 
prophesied, for that is a greater gift; un-
less tongues were accompanied by inter-
pretation, that the church might receive 
edification. If Paul came among them with 
tongues, he would not profit them; but 
revelation, knowledge, prophesying, or doc-
trine would be of real value to them, v.7. 

Musical instruments must give a dis-
tinction in sounds, if the tune is to be rec-
ognized, v.8. The trumpet must give a 
certain sound, or no one will understand 

Chapter Fourteen 
The Apostle desired that the saints 

would "follow after love," as the greatest 
of all blessings. They were to "desire 
spiritual gifts" as well, but specially that 
they might prophesy, v.1. A tongue, unless 
understood by others, could not edify, v.2. 
He might indeed speak mysteries, but 
others were not -blessed, for they did 
not understand him. But a prophet, 
when he speaks, edifies, exhorts and com-
forts others, v.3, and love always aims at 
the good of others. Speaking in tongues, 
might edify the one so doing, but not the 
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translation. Eph.1;13 is a present parti-
ciple "having believed, ye were sealed." 

We are urged to "covet earnestly the 
best gifts," for a gift is to profit the saints, 
and to glorify God. There is something, 
however, more excellent than gift, v.31. 

Chapter Thirteen 

Tongues are spectacular and amazing 
(Acts 2;7) but without love, are "sounding 
brass or a tinkling (clanging) cymbal," v. 
1. Prophecy, understanding, knowledge 
and faith, in whatever degree,without love, 
are nothing, v.2. Benevolence, and suffer-
ing, even to martyrdom, without love, 
profit nothing, v.3. 

"Love suffereth long and is kind; love 
envieth not; love vaunteth not itself, is not 
puffed up, doth not behave itself unseemly, 
3eeketh not her own, is not easily pro-
,oked, thinketh no evil, rejoiceth not in 
niquity, but rejoiceth in the truth," vs.4-6. 
r,ove bears, believes, hopes, endures, never 
:Eails, vs.7,8. Prophecies have failed—there 
are no foretellers of the future on earth 
now. Tongues have ceased, for the thing 
displayed now is mostly a cheap imitation 
of what was common in apostolic times. 
Knowledge (partial, see next verse) will 
vanish away. We know a little of this and 
a little of that, but, thank God the perfect 
is coming (v.10) and the partial will van-
ish, or rather be swallowed up in it. In-
fancy is followed by maturity, and dim 
and partial vision will give place to perfect 
sight and absolute knowledge, v.12. Apos-
tolic, prophetic and spectacular gifts are 
gone, but faith, hope and love abide, v.13. 
Faith and hope are for the journey, but 
love is for the home, as well as for the 
road. It abides forever. I will not need 
faith, nor hope, in heaven, but "God is 
Love" and "Love is of God." Love abides 
eternally. Hallelujah! 

What is your life? James 4:14. 
Indescribable, but tangible; 

'Tis ours to make or mar. 
We can drag it through the mud, 

Or we can "hitch it to a star." 

S. MCLEOD TOCHER. 

INTERCESSION 
By SAMUEL TAYLOR 

Prayer Requests 

Pray for continued blessing on the min-
istry of LIGHT AND LIBERTY. 

Information that came to the editor of 
this page through a public intimation in a 
certain assembly shows that there is need 
for prayerful exercise about the support 
of faithful evangelists who are endeavor-
ing to function properly. 

Pray earnestly, in the light of the ap-
parently near coming of the Lord, that 
business depression may not unwarrant-
ably curtain gospel effort. 

A letter has come to Ontario, Canada, 
inquiring for a Mrs. Mary Blanche Hill, 
who is believed to be associated with an 
assembly in Canada. Information regard-
ing her whereabouts would be welcomed 
by Mrs. Mabel Bartea ux Fate, 516 Boccac-
cio Ave., Venice, Cal., U.S.A. 

Pray for the servants of the Lord in 
foreign parts and in home-lands. 

May much prayer be made for Christ-
ians who are in business and who are 
sorely tried owing to present economic 
conditions. 

Pray that assemblies may be kept true 
to the Word of God, :in these days of de-
clension. 

Praise God for answering prayer on 
behalf of Mr. John Watt. He hopes to be 
preaching again by the time this is in print. 

Pray for brother Fischer of Baltimore 
who has met with a serious accident. 

Pray earnestly that Mauroism may not 
disrupt our assemblies. 

Please pray that our young people may 
not be caught by Buchmanism (called The 
Oxford Group Movement) . 
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CURRENT EVENTS 
By TOM M. OLSON 

Is Russia Conceding Defeat? 
The March number of Harpers con-

tains an article by Maurice Hindus en-
titled: "Has The Five Year Plan Worked?" 

In this article, Hindus says: "Russian 
revolutionaries no longer even get excited 
about religion, not because they have had 
a change of heart but because they regard 
the issue as settled. Never before in a pub-
lic demonstration in the streets were there 
so few anti-religious banners and posters 
as in the celebration of the 15th Anniver-
sary of the Revolution. Anti-religious so-
cieties, which even two years ago were 
flamingly and boisterously in evidence all 
over the country, are hardly heard of now-
adays. The Russian revolutionaries regard 
their fight with religion as finished." 

Yet the same writer estimates that 
"possibly less than one-fourth" of the 
Churches in Russia are still functioning. 

Can it be that Russia is beginning to 
hear that "dreadful sound" in its ears, 
which Eliphaz wrote about? "Trouble and 
anguish shall make him afraid, . . . for he 
stretcheth out his hand against God" (Job 
15: 21-25) . 

Almost Perpetual Motion 
The nearest thing to man's oldest and 

most futile dream—perpetual motion—was 
on exhibit at Grand Central Palace recent-
ly. 

The machine produces power without 
fuel or human aid.. Engineers said it was 
so near to perpetual motion that only an 
engineer could understand why it was not. 

The machine works on a thermody-
namic principle, utilizing water and vapor 
to produce its power. Engineers explained 
the chief reasons it was not perpetual mo-
tion were that its parts would wear out 
and that it could be stopped. 

Man in his helplessness to invent some- 
thing which will never wear out and which  
cannot be stopped should listen to the 
Psalmist who said: "God bath spoken 

once; twice have I heard this; that power 
belongeth unto God" (Psa.62: 11) . 

Mussolini's Militant Peace 
With the Italian Premier's power in 

world affairs becoming steadily more con-
firmed, his ideas on peace are of interna-
tional interest. 

A writer for the Herald-Tribune Maga-
zine had the privilege of personally asking 
Mussolini what he really thought of world 
peace, and if he believed that permanent 
peace were possible and desirable. 

Mussolini answered: "I am not a paci-
fist, but I am for the longest period of 
peace possible. I deny perpetual peace. It 
is death. Certain human virtues grow weak 
if they are condemned never to be tem-
pered in struggle." 

When asked how long a peace he had 
in mind when he spoke of "the longest 
period of peace possible," he answered: 
"Fifty years—a hundred years." 

How much superior is the plan of the 
"Blessed and Only Potentate!" Concern-
ing His future reign the Psalmist said: "In 
His days shall the righteous flourish; and 
abundance of peace so long as the moon 
endureth" (Psa.72: 7) . 

The New Micro-Wave Phone Line 
Marconi has perfected the world's first 

ultra-short-wave telephone; and he pre-
dicts that this micro-wave radio will be the 
world's future method of communication. 

He said the new system is of great 
scientific interest because the communica-
tion is entirely over land, and the micro-
waves can leap obstacles in the visual line 
between stations. 

It is of interest to note that the first 
city to have a short-wave telephone sta-
tion is Rome; and the first person to be 
heard over the line was the Pope. And 
the occasion was the fourth anniversary of 
the signing of the Lateran Treaty, which 
ended fifty years of estrangement between 
the Vatican and Italy. 

The pontiff said that the signing of that 
Treaty should produce a "luminous fu-
ture." 

After reading Revelation 17, one won- 
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ders if "ominous" would not be a more 
descriptive word than "luminous" in the 
pontiff's message. 

Changing Churches and Hymns 

Harold V. Milligan, choirmaster of the 
Riverside Church, New York City, informs 
us that the "old fashioned church" was a 
preaching station. People went to church 
and then went home! "The modern church," 
he says, "with its parish house, bowling 
alley, gymnasium, and perhaps dances is 
an entirely different place." 

And as to hymns, this organist says: 
"Most of the hymns that were being used 
even when I was a boy were all about 
what poor, miserable sinners we were! I 
remember one phrase, 'Such a worm as I.' 
`Jesus, Lover of my Soul' was pretty bad, 
though it's still sung." 

He goes on to say: "In enlightened 
communities now they've thrown out all 
that sort of thing—they're just left out of 
the hymn books. We're getting more and 
more hymns by men like Chesterton, Kip-
ling, and Henry Van Dyke about world 
brotherhood, peace and good will. The 
most striking feature of modern hymns is 
their emphasis on world brotherhood." 

Changing old hymns and churches will 
not change human nature. "Miserable 
sinners" still need the Lord Jesus, the 
great Lover of souls; and it is a matter of 
profound thanksgiving that He changes 
not. 

QUESTIONS and ANSWERS 
To be addressed to Mr. A. N. O'Brien, 
227 W. Victoria Street, Duluth, Minn. 

Question No. 18—"He was buried and He rose 
again, according to the Scriptures" (1 Cor.15: 4). 
What Scriptures? Please give chapter and verse. 

Answer—If the inquirer will turn to 
Acts 2: 25-28 he will find Peter answers 
the question very decidedly by quoting 
David's prediction in Psalm 16 of the res-
urrection of Christ.—Winsor Chase. 

Question No. 23—If leaven typifies evil why is 
it found in the sacrifices mentioned in Lev.23: 17 
and Amos 4:5? 

Answer—Lev.23 treats of "the feasts of 
the Lord," v.2. The first feast is the Pass-
over, v.5. This speaks of the death of our 
Lord. Then comes the "sheaf of the first-
fruits," vs.10,11. There was no sin-offering 
accompanying this, for it represents Christ 
in resurrection; and in Him was no sin. 
But the "two wave loaves," of v.17, were 
brought out of their habitations on the 
50th day after the sheaf of firstfruits was 
waved. They represent Pentecost, and the 
offering of the church to God. Compare 
Rom.15,16, where the believing Gentiles 
are spoken of as an offering to God. The 
same thought is suggested in Phil.2: 17. 
But since the two loaves of Lev.23: 17 rep-
resent the church, they were to be "baken 
with leaven," for there is surely sin in us, 
even though we are past condemnation. 
With this presentation of the two loaves 
there was a sin offering (v.19) for the sin 
in believers is perfectly met by the sacri-
fice of Christ. 

Amos 4: 5 probably refers to Lev.7: 12, 
13, where a sacrifice of a peace offering, 
for thanksgiving, was to have one loaf of 
leavened bread, for our thanksgivings al-
ways have some selfishness in them. 

—A.N.O'Brien. 

The Two Prayers 

Last night my little boy confessed to me 
some childish wrong, 

And kneeling at my knee he prayed with 
tears; 

"Dear God, make me a man 
Like Daddy, wise and strong: I know You 

can!" 

Then while he slept I knelt beside his bed, 
Confessed my sins, and prayed with low-

bowed head; 
"0 God, make me a child, like my child 

here— 
Pure, guileless, trusting Thee with faith 

sincere!" 

—"The Expositor." 

Let us get rid of the hunger marks on 
our faces, so that we may commend the 
Gospel to others—Selected. 
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UNITED STATES 

Mr. J. 0. Brown spent five weeks recently at 
Gentry, Ark. The little assembly seemed helped 
though there was much opposition. 

Williamson, Iowa—The saints are again ex-
tending an invitation to attend the all day meeting 
to be held Sunday, April 9th. Basket dinner. 

E. G. Dillon, whose address is 117 South 
Maple St., Sturgis, Mich., has been giving his 
whole time to the work of the Lord for more 
than a year. He had a few meetings in Joliet, 
Ill., in November. His next series of meetings 
was in Kalamazoo, Mich., where four were saved 
and added to the meeting. Later he had four 
weeks in Otsego, Mich., in a gospel hall used by 
a mission. Four souls professed Christ, and the 
Christians in the mission, who had already with-
drawn from the denominations, were instructed 
further in the ways of the Lord. On the third 
Sunday of his meetings about thirty of them 
broke bread together. They had never seen, nor 
heard of, such a meeting. Bro. Will Pell, of Grand 
Rapids, has helped them since, also saints from 
the meetings at Grand Haven, and from Sturgis. 
Bro. Dillon hopes to labor in Fort Wayne, Ind. 

A. B. Miller has had meetings in Elgin, Ill., 
Lafflin St. and Washington Heights in Chicago, 
Ill., and in Kalamazoo, Mich., U. S. A., and 
Windsor, Stratford, Staffordville and Tilsenberg, 
in Ontario. He hopes to visit Orillia, Toronto and 
Peterboro while in Canada. 

Riverside, Calif.—The annual conference will 
be held, o.v., on Easter Sunday, April 16th, at the 
American Legion club house, Fairmont Park, 
Riverside. Order of meetings: 10:30 a. m., 2:30 
and 7:00 p. m. The prayers and presence of God's 
people will be appreciated (1 Thess.5:25). 

Germantown, Philadelphia — The conference 
held on Feb. 22nd was well attended and the 
ministry very profitable. Messrs. Jennings, Hill, 
Tharp, Hamilton and McCandless shared the min-
istry. 

Baltimore, IV 
Washington's bi 
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Lord opens the 

Miami, Fla., 
Crocker of Galt 
Island, has bee 
February minist  

ner, and we have seen fruit to the glory of God 
There were nine young people baptized last Sun-
day evening, the hall being filled. Bro. Crocke r  
went on to Palm Beach for ten days, and will be 
with us again later. Interest still continues and 
we pray for further blessing." 

Camden, N. J.—The one week of meetings by 
James F. Spink on "Revelation" was much ap -
preciated. A goodly number were present at the 
meetings which were enjoyed by all. H.C.R. 

Geo. M. Landis is working in the Greenwood 
Hills district and is having encouragement with 
the work among the children. 

Grand Haven, Mich.—The Lord is blessing the 
Pell brothers in this district. Quite a few are 
being saved and our brethren are greatly en-
couraged. 

B. M. Nottage spent four weeks in Detroit, two 
weeks in Cleveland and one week in Chicago and 
saw blessing among the colored people in each 
place. He is now having meetings at Rehoboth 
Chapel, New York. 

John Hunt had good meetings in El Paso, Tex .  
Baptized two women who were saved some time 
ago. Had two weeks meetings in San Antonio 
when a young man professed to be saved. Also 
had nearly three weeks meetings in Houston with 
F. W. Schwartz with interest and blessing. 

Boas St., Harrisburg—James F. Spink spen t 
a week here. Ministry appreciated by good audi 
ences. One professed to be saved. 

Flint, Mich.—"We made final arrangements to 
secure a suitable building for our meetings on 
Saginaw St., which is the main thoroughfare 
through the city (Dixie Highway). The new hall is 
about twice as large as our old building and seats 
about 200, and is known as Gracelawn Assembly 
Hall. We worked hard and got the hall ready for 
occupancy by Jan. 1st and held our second an-
nual conference in it for two days, Jan. 12. Since 
then we have been having six weeks of special 
evangelistic meetings, during which a score or 
more have professed conversion." 

Gospel Hall, Tc.ppenish, Wash.—The depres 
sion has been taken advantage of by the little as 
sembly here. Gospel meetings were advertise' 
with free luncheons for the needy and unem 
ployed. The start was small but rapidly in 
creased until the house was filled with hungr: 
listeners. It has helped break down prejudice 
and quite a number professed to be saved. Th 
first four weeks of meetings were conducted b: 
Pearson Mills, followed by three weeks of min 
istry by Geo. L. Hunt. 

Id.—A conference was held on 
rthday at Arunah Avenue Gospel 
Ki ministry by Messrs. McKenzie, 
ndis and Spink. Large number 
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E. K. Bailey is having meetings about 20 miles 
from Salem, Oregon, and is finding interest and 
encouragement in country places. 

Kelker Street Gospel Hall, Harrisburg—"Geo. 
McKenzie came here early in December, and 
with slight interruption continued until March 
7th. We had lectures on the book of Revelation. 
also some Bible readings in Romans and Gala-
tians. Seven confessed Christ as their Savior and 
six have been added to the assembly. For a con-
siderable time there has been much exercise 
among the saints at Kelker Street, and those at 
Second and State Street about coming together. 
Progress has been slow and very deliberate. Sev-
eral conferences between brethren appointed by 
each of these meetings were marked by much 
prayer and frank inquiry into all matters con-
cerning doctrine and practice. The result was 
that no Scriptural reason could be found to keep 
these two meetings apart. It was agreed by both 
companies to fix up the hall at Kelker Street and 
while this was being done we met together at 
State St. On Lord's day, March 5th, we had an 
all-day meeting. About 250 were present. Rich-
ard Hill and Geo. McKenzie ministered in the 
afternoon and Geo. McCandless preached the 
gospel at night. Two professed to be saved, and 
thus a day of blessed intercourse in the things of 
the Lord was brought to a glad ending." 

El Paso, Tex.—The third annual conference 
was held over the week-end of Jan.21-23. Breth-
ren Hunt, Swartz, Allingham and Thompson min-
istered. Though not so many attended as at 
previous conferences, yet it was a time of uplift-
ing and fellowship. 

Albuquerque, New Mexico — "This is new 
ground as far as "open" testimony is concerned, 
yet a fruitful and encouraging visit was paid by 
brethren Allington and Robert Thompson from 
Texas. Meetings at Five Points and at Barton 
were very well attended, and it is hoped to re-
turn to these parts during the month of June, 
and build up the work started." 

Nordheim, Texas — The weekly Bible class 
carried on in the home of Mr. Robert Thompson 
continues with increasing interest. The ladies 
attending are of a truth "searching the scriptures 
daily. 

New York City—F. C. Jennings and E. Buck-
ler gave appreciated help in Elizabeth, New Jer-
sey. R. J. MacLachian was in Brooklyn giving 
help in the gospel. His visit was much enjoyed 
by the saints. We are glad that our brother has 
regained his health. The conference at Fenimore 
Street, Brooklyn, was well attended. Helpful 
words by F. C. Jennings, G. Hamilton, R. Hill 
and Walter Munroe. 

Loan of Gospel Tent—Mr. W. M. Rae, Laurel 
View Apts., 32nd and E. Pine, Portland, Oregon, 
would value the loan of a tent for the Pacific 
coast for the early part of the season, or if any 
person has a cheap one for sale he would gladly 
consider buying same. 

Pittsburgh, Pa., North Side—James F. Spink 
had a week here. Attendance good and saints 
much refreshed by the ministry of the word. J.M. 

Hartford, Conn.—Gavin Hamilton gave seven 
addresses on the Lord's second coming Feb. 5-10. 
Meetings well attended and ministry greatly en-
joyed. 

Aldine, Ind.—Mr. Jas. G. Gilbert of Chicago 
held three weeks meetings here during Feb. and 
March which proved very helpful to the Christ-
ians, and some professed faith in Christ. 

Baltimore, Md.—James F. Spink held a series 
of meetings here on the coming again of our 
blessed Lord. Attendance was by far the best 
that we have had for years. John Conaway also 
spent a week-end with us and cheered the little 
flock. M.T.B. 

Harold Jones and Frank M. Detweiler—"We 
have just completed five weeks of tent meetings 
at Rivera, Fla., with good interest and two con-
fessing Christ as Savior. For the past three weeks 
we have preached here in Key West, Fla. This is 
our third visit and we are encouraged to find 
many who have trusted Christ on our former 
visits going on well; becoming pillars in the as-
sembly. We believe three souls have trusted 
Christ and others are exercised who will no 
doubt be saved as the meetings continue through 
Bro. V. Pennington from Bloomfield, N. J." 

Terre Haute, Ind.—T. B. Gilbert spent March 
5th here when four were baptized. The breth-
ren have moved into a church building and are 
being much encouraged by the attendance at the 
gospel meetings and also in the Sunday School. 

Des Moines, Iowa — The Annual Conference 
will be held, D.v., from May 28th to 30th, com-
mencing with prayer meeting Saturday, May 27th. 
Full particulars from T. E. McCully, 1102 19th St. 

Hugh Kane, Monrovia, Calif.—"Will you please 
announce through LIGHT AND LIBERTY that Mrs. 
Kane and I are safe. There was no loss of life, 
injury, or property damage in Monrovia. Of 
course, we are in the quake zone, and felt it to 
an extent that was rather uncomfortable. 

We were eating supper when we heard a 
rumbling noise and the house shook and swayed. 
The dishes on the table began to dance. We went 
outdoors immediately, that being the safest place. 
For a few seconds we found it hard to keep on 
our feet as the earth rocked. Long Beach was 
the hardest hit. None of the Christians were hurt. 
I went over there a few days ago to see them. 
I found some of them, like many others, sleeping 
in tents and cooking their meals on the side walk. 
All school buildings were wrecked, as well as 
stores and homes—none of the Lord's gathered 
out people received even a scratch. One family 
has lost practically all, their home is wrecked 
and their living gone. People are living in sus-
pense, lest there be a recurrance of this awful 
disaster. 

Surely, such things should make people think 
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Eleuthera, Bahamas—Conference will be held 
at Tarpum Bay, Eleuthera April 8th to 10th in-
clusive for prayer and ministry of the Word. 
Those coming from a distance please write to 
S. B. Thompson. 

Grenada—J. H. McKay writes of fresh interest 
and blessing at La Digue and of a new opening at 
Sauteurs, in the extreme north, where a family 
from Tobago has gone to reside. Another worker 
urgently needed. 

PORTUGUESE WEST AFRICA 

T. Ernest Wilson, Malange—"We think that an 
undue amount of stress is being laid on the value 
of celibacy for the pioneer missionaries. We be-
lieve that the balance of truth lies the other way. 
There is a great danger of a single young man in 
a pioneer district neglecting his health and ruin-
ing his body through overwork and badly cooked 
and prepared meals. More breakdowns have re-
sulted from this cause than any other. Then in a 
country like Africa where promiscuous immor-
ality is the normal village life in certain parts, a 
single young man is a mystery to the natives. It 
is better for his own testimony's sake and for 
many other reasons to be married. The writer 
has been engaged for six years past in opening 
up a new country where the above conditions 
prevail. He would pay a tribute to the splendid 
work of his wife who has shared hardships from 
the very first without a complaint. Any success 
in the salvation of souls is largely due to her 
help. Thank God for the pioneer women of Africa! 
They are legion. 

"One thinks of the isolated workers in the 
depths of an African forest whose bodies are 
riddled with malaria and who run daily risk of 
contracting serious disease. Some live hundreds 
of miles from the nearest medical help and wage 
a continual warfare against the naked forces of 
heathenism. Constrained by the love to Christ 
they have their full share of suffering, which 
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they endure without complaint. Of course it is 
possible to be sidetracked, and one could spend 
their time big game hunting or in geographical 
exploration, etc., but the true soul winner has 
more important work to do. We trust that these 
few remarks will stir you up to pray for the 
work and workers in this benighted land." 

Recalling an article in a former issue of LIGHT 
AND LIBERTY by Mr. Harold Barker about the 
"Smiths" and as the only sister of the Perrin 
Smith referred to I regret not being sufficiently 
artistic to picture in your readers' minds the 
home; and to enable them to breathe in the at-
mosphere which were among our blessings, from 
our trundle bed, which was rolled under mother's 
and father's bed, during the day, to save space: 

Saved parents with open hearts and tender 
consciences for GOD and His Word, putting these 
first in time and substance bowed, with us, at the 
beginning of each day, committing us to their 
Father's tender care and keeping. 

At the ages of 13, 11 and 9 respectively we 
were bereaved of our dear father, but mother, 
lovingly and firmly, persisted in the same, even 
when we were rushed with hard work and puz-
zled to make ends meet. 

I am persuaded that when Canada and United 
States produce more homes like that the different 
mission fields will be better supplied with work-
ers, and it is immaterial whether they are "Smiths, 
Browns, or Joneses." 

Yours humbly in His service, 
Mrs. E. W. Brown ( formerly Minnie Smith). 

Footnote—Mrs. Brown has been laboring in 
South America with her husband E. W. Brown 
for over thirty years, and they have done faith-
ful service, plodding on all these years. They are 
worthy of the prayers and confidence of the 
Lord's people everywhere.—R. W. Rycroft. 

WITH THE LORD 
William Stevenson, Belfast, age 63. Born in 

Lisburn and saved early in life. Spent a number 
of years in different parts of Canada, chiefly 
Toronto. Returned to Belfast and for the past 
twenty years gave all his time to the Lord's work. 
He had a long record of self-denying service both 
in Ulster and the Irish Free State. He was a 
preacher of the pioneer type and was much used 
in opening up districts for the gospel. He passed 
peacefully into the presence of the Lord on Feb. 
6th. The last hymn he tried to sing was: 

Onward, upward, homeward 
Joyfully I flee 

From this world of sorrow, 
With my Lord to be. 

Brethren Poots, Bingham, Bailie, and McKelvey 
took part in the funeral services. 

Duncan Anderson went to be with the Lord 
on Feb. 17th at the age of 73. He was saved at 
Bancroft Ont., in 1896 and has remained in fel-
lowship with the Lord's people until the end. 
A brother much beloved, he died at Calgary and 
was buried at Kirriemuir. Four sons and three 
daughters mourn his loss. Funeral services were 
large and were conducted by E. Roughby and A. 
R. Stephenson. 

Frederick Clare of Toronto went to be with 
Christ on Feb. 17th, age 82. Saved 66 years ago, 
he associated himself with those meeting in the 
name of the Lord. He took keen interest in the 
spread of the gospel and was actively engaged 
with the efforts of the British and Foreign Bible 
Society and the China Inland Mission. The fu-
neral service was held in the Olivet Gospel Hall 
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where he had been a regular attendant for ten 
years. Richard Irving and S. K. Peterson con-
ducted the services. He leaves a widow for whom 
prayer is requested. 

Dr. E. A. Martin, for twenty years editor of 
"Words in Season," had been in ill-health for 
some time and on Wednesday, Feb. 22nd, took a 
hemorrhage and was unconscious all day Friday 
until 7:15 p. m., when he passed peacefully into 
the presence of the Lord whom he loved and 
served so many years. The services were held 
from the home of the Misses Copp, West Med-
ford, Mass., where he resided since returning 
from California a year ago. Mr. W. P. Douglas, 
J. Pearson and Chas. Keller conducted the serv-
ices in the home. Hugh Thorpe took the service 
at the grave. Christians connected with the as-
semblies in Maine, New Hampshire, Rhode Is-
land, Massachusetts, Connecticut, Pennsylvania 
and Ohio attended. His faithful wife survives 
him, whom we might remember in prayer. 

Word has come that Mr. J. Clement of Lipton, 
Sask., has passes into the presence of the Lord 
while on a visit to England. Bro. Clement was 
for many years in the Lipton district, and bore 
a good testimony. It was his first visit to Eng-
land since his coming to this country many years 
ago. His wife and two daughters are in Saskatoon 
and much prayer is asked for them. 

BOOK REVIEWS 
By SAMUEL TAYLOR 

Annual Prophetical Conference (March, 1932). 
Notes of the addresses revised by the speakers. 
Speakers: H. A. Ironside, Canon F. E. Howitt, 
James MacFarlane. Paper. 114 pp. Price 35c. 
Toronto: Home Evangel Book Shop. 

This book is published by authority of the 
Prophetical Investigation Society of Toronto. It 
contains valuable expositions of prophetic Scrip-
tures, and matter of a very interesting nature. 
It should be helpful to persons who are exercised 
about whether the Church will go through the 
tribulation or about Daniel's 70th Week. 

The Prophetic Lamp. By Ernest Baker. Paper. 
79 pp. Price 55c. Glasgow: Pickering and Inglis. 

Deals with prophecies concerning Christ, Is-
rael, The Nations, and The Church. Non-believ-
ing enquirers should here find proofs that the 
Bible is a Divine Revelation. The treatment of 
prophetic scriptures, and the information, bearing 
on prophetic matters, that is given, should inter-
est Christians. 

Studies in the Epistle to the Hebrews. By 
eorge Henderson. Paper. 128 pp. Price Mc. 
arkingside, Essex: G. F. Valiance.  
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The studies are a feast of fat things. This 
choice ministry shows close study, wide reading, 
and ripe experience. The student of Scripture 
should add to his library this book which con-
tains rich portions of exposition. 

This Believing World. By Lewis Browne. 
Cloth. 347 pp. New York: The MacMillan Co. 

In a brief, simple, manner this book covers a 
wide field of inquiry. What in it is historical and 
accurate has value. The treatment of its im-
portant subject, "A simple account of the great 
religions of mankind," is strongly flavored by the 
theory of evolution, and is decidedly "modern-
istic." The birth-place of religion is the fear that 
dwelt in the heart of savage man, "poor, gibber-
ing half-ape"—according to this treatise (Romans, 
chapter one, explains how and why men became 
idolaters). The accounts of Judaism and of 
Christianity, show a tragic ignorance of the 
Bible, and exemplify the Scripture, "The natural 
man receiveth not the things of the Spirit of 
God: for they are foolishness unto him: neither 
can he know them, because they are spiritually 
discerned" (1 Cor.2:11). 

The book, though written in a mild tone, is 
thoroughly anti-Christian. It places Jesus on a 
level with leaders of religious cults, and rejects 
His proper Deity. 

That the book has passed through sixteen re-
prints is a sad commentary on present conditions. 

CHANGE OF ADDRESS 

Louis J. Germain, Deseronto, Ont., Canada. 

The Gospel Ambassador for April carries two 
articles entitled "The Coming Storm" written by 
H. P. Barker and Geo. Cutting. Order from 
LIGHT AND LIBERTY Pus. Co., Fort Dodge, Iowa. 

Hand lettered Texts, Charts, etc. Any Scrip-
ture painted and beautifully framed size 7 x 20 
$1.50. "Two Roads and Two Destinies" chart, 
new design in colors, 4 x 12 ft. $12.00. Photo sent 
James Kennedy, signwriter, 1810 Alsace Ave., 
Los Angeles, Cal. 

Signs of all kinds, Texts, Charts, Mottoes, etc. 
Your favorite Text painted and suitably framed, 
any style letter on any background, prices aston-
ishingly low. Special on 12 x 16, complete $1.25 
up. John Bryson, 632 E. Ontario Street, Phila-
delphia, Pa. 1-34p. 

Prostate gland sufferers. Free information re-
garding a treatment from which I have received 
amazing relief. No obligation, I have nothing to 
sell. "Freely ye have received, freely give." 
Write A. N. Beadle, 1649 W. Minnehaha St., St. 
Paul, Minn. 
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Light & Liberty Annuals 

Commercial Printing 

Book and Pamphlet 
Publishing 

Carefully and promptly executed in one of 
the most modern printing plants 

known among Christians. 
I 

sigh! 	thcrig 

Conference Announcements neatly printed 

Some of the largest business firms in Iowa 
are among our customers. 

LIGHT & LIBERTY PUB. CO . 
Fort Dodge, Iowa, U.S.A. 

Specially Priced at $1.25 
A few 1931 volumes left 

LIGHT & LIBERTY PUB. CO . 
Fort Dodge, Iowa, U.S.A. 

INTRODUCING 
TWO MONTHLY GOSPEL PAPERS 

Edited by W. T. McLean 

Glad Tidings 	 35c per year 
Sunlight for the Young 	35c per year 

(Cheaper in Quantities) 
Send for samples or subscriptions to 

CENTRAL BIBLE, BOOK & TRACT DEPOT 
703 Fine Arts Bldg., Detroit, Mich. 

Biblical Jig Saw Puzzles 
Entertaining and Instructive for Young and Old 

25c ea. 
$2.75 Per Doz.—Add 100f,, for Postage 

Distributed By 

Central Bible, Book & Tract Depot 
703 Fine Arts Bldg., 58 W. Adams Ave., Detroit, Mich. 

Song Books 
FOR EVERY OCCASION 

Redemption Songs, 1000 Hymns and 
Choruses, Cloth Limp, Words and 
Music   $2.50 
Words and Music, Hvy. Paper ... $1.25 
Words Only, small type 	$ .20 
Words Only, Boards, lg. type 	$ .50 

Believer's Hymn Book, Large type 
and music, Cloth 	 $1.35 
Persian Morocco Limp 	$3.00 
Morocco Yapp Lined 	$6.00 
Words Only, boards, sm. type $ .30 

100 Gospel Choruses for Young and 
Old, by A. P. Gibbs 	 $ .35 

New Gems of Song, a new hymn 
book, choice collection of 200 hymns, 
sacred songs, and choir pieces, pub-
lished by Allan & Son, Glasgow. 
Price, paper cover 85c; cloth boards 
$1.25. 

Pilgrim Preachers' Chorus Book, 60 
choruses, paper 	 $ .20 

GOOD NEWS ! 
New Prices for "THE GOSPEL AMBASSADOR" 

Edited by James F. Spink 

5 Copies monthly, per yr. 	$1.25 
10 Copies monthly, per yr 	$2.00 
25 Copies monthly, per yr. 	$4.00 
50 Copies monthly, per yr. 	$7.00 

100 Copies monthly (localized), 
per month 	 $1.00 

500 Copies monthly (localized), 
per month 	 $4.50 

1000 Copies monthly (localized), 
per month 	 $7.50 

PUBLISHED MONTHLY BY 

GOSPEL FOLIO PRESS, 817 North Ave., N. E., Grand Rapids, Mich. 
Order from LIGHT AND LIBERTY PUB. CO., Fort Dodge, Iowa, U. S. A. 

WHAT OTHERS SAY ABOUT IT 
Employment manager in one of Detroit's 

automobile factories—"I must say they (The 
Gospel Ambassadors) are very good. They have 
an appeal to the man or woman of business by 
their neat and attractive set up. My hope and 
prayer is that the precious seed in this manner 
may prosper and be the means of bringing many 
to the Lord Jesus Christ." 

Christian business man in Gary, Ind.—"Some 
time ago from some source I came into posses-
sion of one of your publications under the head-
ing 'The Gospel Ambassador' featuring 'Facing 
the Facts,' which seems an unusually fitting 
tract for truly all business men, generally speak -  
ing." 

School teacher. Philadelphia—"I received the 
copies of The Gospel Ambassador.' It is cer-
tainly attractive." 
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